8/17/2021 Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

CB 7802K - Finalize

Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Tue 17/8/2021 12:04 PM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

0 1 attachments (448 KB)
CB 7802 main estimate.pdf;

Hi Denise,

FYI.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 16 August 2021 10:22 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: CB 7802K - Finalize

Hi Steve

Ok

Thanks & regards

On 16 Aug 2021, at 18:27, Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

HI Winnie,

Kindly refer our finalize $920 (P/P, before GST). 3 repair days.
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Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

<CB 7802 main estimate.pdf>
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