8/24/2021

Re: SNM21D204045/C02/CB7182R/TAYHP / China Taiping ref - CB7182R / Our ref -

Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

SMW?174G Mazda / doa 21-7-2021 / Finalize COR /

Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Tue 24/8/2021 11:58 AM

To: jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg <jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg>

Cc: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>; Ng Mei Yen <meiyen.ng@eurokars.com.sg>; Stephanie Loke

<stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Dear Jess,

Confirm final figure at $6068, 5 Days

Please submit your relevant documents directly to China Taiping

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jess Francis Carlos <jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 23 August, 2021 3:33 PM

To: Thevan (LKK Auto) <Thevan@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>; Ng Mei Yen <meiyen.ng@eurokars.com.sg>; Stephanie Loke

<stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM21D204045/C02/CB7182R/TAYHP / China Taiping ref - CB7182R / Our ref - SMW174G Mazda /
doa 21-7-2021 / Finalize COR /

Dear Thevan,

Kindly review the attachment and let us have the confirmation in order to close this case.

LABOR PARTS Total
3,800.00 2,268.00 6,068.00
Repair
days
5
Thank you.

Jess Francis Carlos

Insurance Claims Executive

Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKAGNIMTQ1ODBhLTcONjYINGE3OCOSNWVKLTMyZWUwWMGFhNWIXNAAQAPpGwTgmq02av%2BhspNg. ..
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mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com

8/24/2021 Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

27A Tanjong Penjuru
Singapore 609042
Tel no.: 8128 9802

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is
confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then
delete this message from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other

person. Thank you.

() ELROKARS SERVICES

Eurckars Group

From: Tan Wei Cin <weicin.tan@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: 19 August 2021 6:08 PM

To: thevan@lkkauto.com

Cc: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>; Jason Wong <jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Stephanie Loke
<stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg>; Jess Francis Carlos <jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: SNM21D204045/C02/CB7182R/TAYHP / China Taiping ref - CB7182R / Our ref - SMW174G Mazda / doa
21-7-2021 / supp labour

Hi Thevan,
Kindly refer to the attachment for your approval.
Thanks.

Best Regards,
Wei Cin

27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042
T: (65) 63310680 D: (65) 6331 0681
E: weicin.tan@eurokars.com.sg W: www.eurokarsgroup.com

(®) ELROKARS SERVICES
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