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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) 
<TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 July 2020 9:59 AM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A
Cc: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)
Subject: Yr Ref : CC3/AIG19004939/Jeb3        Our Ref : BUS/11/18/5016

Follow Up Flag: Flag for follow up
Flag Status: Completed

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Morning Asher,  
 
We refer to the above matter and your rejection dated 09/09/2019. 
Please be informed that the Settlement Judge indicated liability at 50/50 and the solicitor acting for the driver of 
SLX6202B accepted our 50% contribution. 
Kindly review and let us have your offer to settle our claim soon, thanks. 
 

Cost of repair $ 1,238.00 
Loss of use  $ 550.00 (2 days @$275.00/day) 
LTA search fee $ 7.00 
Total $ 1,795.00 

 
We enclose the following documents : 

1. Repair Invoice 
2. LTA search fee 
3. SAS report 

 
Regards, 
 
 
Patrick Tan 
Claims and Insurance Agency 
Direct line +65 6556 3522| tanweiteck@smrt.com.sg 
6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62 
Singapore 569140 
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>
Sent: Monday, 26 July 2021 10:38 AM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: [APPREAL REJECTION] Your Ref: 3117093283SG // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX 

6202B AND SMB 1443J 10/11/2018

Hi Asher, 
 
Agreed on the 50/50. 
 
Sent back in Merimen. 
 
Regards, 
Lee Ming Yao, George 
Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1769 
Ming-Yao.Lee@AIG.com | www.AIG.sg 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 23 July 2021 12:18 
To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: [APPREAL REJECTION] Your Ref: 3117093283SG // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX 6202B AND 
SMB 1443J 10/11/2018 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Hi Ming Yao, 
 
We refer to the email dated 27/04/21. 
 
Kindly advise on third party appeal on the rejection. 
 
If agreed on the 50% settlement please kindly assist to send back the report. 
 
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
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From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 27 April 2021 5:22 PM 
To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Subject: RE: [APPREAL REJECTION] Your Ref: 3117093283SG // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX 6202B AND SMB 1443J 
10/11/2018 
 
Hi Ming Yao, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Enclosed a copy of the email from third party for your easy reference. 
 
Kindly advise. 
 
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 28 July 2020 4:46 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [APPREAL REJECTION] Your Ref: 3117093283SG // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX 6202B AND SMB 1443J 
10/11/2018 
 
Hi Asher, 
 
Can request them to provide supporting document from court finding? 
 
Any dispute from OI previously? 
 
Regards, 
Lee Ming Yao, George 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 
 
Tel +(65) 6419 1769 

Ming-Yao.Lee@AIG.com | www.aig.sg 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 27 July 2020 17:19 
To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] [APPREAL REJECTION] Your Ref: 3117093283SG // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX 6202B AND SMB 
1443J 10/11/2018 
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This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Hi Ming Yao, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Third party appeal on the rejection and counter proposed 50% settlement. 
 
Enclosed third party email for your easy reference. 
 
Kindly advise. 
 

Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 


