Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: YT(HQ) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 29 July 2021 10:54 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: UTAUTO@SINGNET.COM.SG

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - Accident involving FBK4724L (NTUC) claiming against SMA6930S

(India) (GRAB) on 21.07.2021 LKK REF : CC4/GRB21007878/bs3

Dear Jasper,
Kindly cancel today’s survey appointment for MEGA at 3pm.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:

Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4,
#01-61, Singapore 417800

Office: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s)
named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies
of it. Thank you.

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, July 26, 2021 10:04 AM

To: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>;
YTKB <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - Accident involving FBK4724L (NTUC) claiming against SMA6930S (India) (GRAB) on
21.07.2021 LKK REF : CC4/GRB21007878/bs3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Liability unclear as our insured driver reported no collision.
Please submit evidence : accident scene photos / video footage.

Thanks



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

W Sayve the Larth Print only when necessary

From: YT(MG) [mailto:utauto@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: July 26, 2021 9:57 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>;
'Motor Claim - IlI' <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; 'Gabriel Wee' <Gabriel@iii.com.sg>; YTKB <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>;
YTHQ <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - Accident involving FBK4724L (NTUC) claiming against SMA6930S (India) (GRAB) on
21.07.2021 LKK REF : CC4/GRB21007878/bs3

Hi Jasper,
Kindly let us have the liability soon.

Thank You @

Best Regards

Ms Lai Yee Meng

—_—
TOLE Toudiio pay iy

YT

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
HQ Office (North):

39 Woodlands Close,

#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856

DID: 6256 2081

Fax: 6256 2533

Email: info@yewteegroup.com

Branch Office (East):
Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road
Unit No #01-60/61

Singapore 417800

DID: 6702 3113



