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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 August 2021 11:06 AM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLX3308A - ECICS OD - Finalization

Good morning, 

 
Please proceed 

 
Thanks! 

Best Regards 
Raymond Teo 

 
To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 
Sin Ming AutoCity 

160 Sin Ming Drive 

Singapore 575722 

Showroom/Office: #03-03 

Workshops: #08-08/09/10 

Tel: 64532121 (4 lines) 

Fax: 64599795 

Website: www.vinsautogroup.com.sg 

Email: claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg 
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** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! ** 

** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! ** 

 
 
On Mon, 23 Aug 2021 at 12:07, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Raymond, 

Finalize COR $6880 before GST @ 3 days. 

COR subject to insurance approval. 

Regards, 

Guo Qiang 


