Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 13 September 2021 2:49 PM

To: SA 0406

Cc: Kenneth Ding; Accounts ( Ding Auto ); Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SJZ8544P AGAINST SBQ2383T - DOA 11/07/2021 - CHECK LIABILITY

Without Prejudice

Dear Kenneth,

Content noted.

Dear Assg team,

FYNA. CC4/AIG21007850/gs3

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
57424
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From: SA 0406 <sa0406@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Monday, 13 September 2021 2:46 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Accounts ( Ding Auto ) <accounts@dingauto.sg>
Subject: Re: TP CLAIMS - SJZ8544P AGAINST SBQ2383T - DOA 11/07/2021 - CHECK LIABILITY

Dear Cecilia,



Good day to you.

Since liability is clear, we would like to arrange for vehicle survey
anytime

after 2.00pm tomorrow. Kindly arrange and advise accordingly.

Thank you.

Henry Lee
Ding Auto Pte Ltd.

Virus-free. www.avast.com

On Mon, Sep 13, 2021 at 2:21 PM Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Kenneth,

Our principal revert that liability is clear.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

wn Save the Larth Print only when necessary-

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 September 2021 3:05 PM

To: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'SA 0406' <sa0406@dingauto.sg>

Cc: 'Accounts ( Ding Auto )' <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SJZ8544P AGAINST SBQ2383T - DOA 11/07/2021 - CHECK LIABILITY

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Kenneth,

We are still pending for our principal’s instruction as they are still investigating in this matter.

Will revert back to you once instruction has been given

Thanks



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 September 2021 2:51 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>; 'SA 0406' <sa0406 @dingauto.sg>
Cc: 'Accounts ( Ding Auto )' <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SJZ8544P AGAINST SBQ2383T - DOA 11/07/2021 - CHECK LIABILITY

Dear Cecilia,

Good day to you.



We would like to follow up on the liability for this case .

Please help us check and advice us as my customer is chasing after it.

Thank you and we look forward to hear from you soon.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding

HP: 92313123

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, August 18, 2021 5:07 PM

To: Kenneth Ding; 'SA 0406’

Cc: 'Accounts ( Ding Auto )'

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SJZ8544P AGAINST SBQ2383T - DOA 11/07/2021 - CHECK LIABILITY

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Kenneth,

We are still pending for instruction from our principal.

We will revert back to you once instruction given.

Thanks



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ L YL

" Save the Larth Print only when necessary-

From: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 August 2021 5:04 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; 'SA 0406' <sa0406@dingauto.sg>
Cc: 'Accounts ( Ding Auto )' <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SJZ8544P AGAINST SBQ2383T - DOA 11/07/2021 - CHECK LIABILITY

Dear Cecilia,

Good day to you.



Kindly advise us if this case liability is clear. Our client has been chasing us for

liability outcome. Hope to hear from you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding
HP: 92313123

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, August 11, 2021 3:44 PM

To: SA 0406

Cc: Kenneth Ding; Accounts ( Ding Auto )

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SJZ8544P AGAINST SBQ2383T - DOA 11/07/2021 - CHECK LIABILITY

Without prejudice

Dear Henry,

We are still pending instruction from our principal as this case is under investigation.

Will revert back to you once investigation has been done.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ L YL

" Save the Larth Print only when necessary-

From: SA 0406 <sa0406@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 7 August 2021 1:45 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Accounts ( Ding Auto ) <accounts@dingauto.sg>
Subject: Re: TP CLAIMS - SJZ8544P AGAINST SBQ2383T - DOA 11/07/2021 - CHECK LIABILITY

Dear Cecilia,

Good day to you.

Kindly advise us if this case liability is clear. Our client has been
chasing us for



liability outcome. Hope to hear from you soon.

Thank you.

Henry Lee

Ding Auto Pte Ltd.

Virus-free. www.avast.com

On Wed, Aug 4, 2021 at 3:03 PM SA 0406 <sa0406 @dingauto.sg> wrote:

Dear Cecilia,

Good day to you.

As per your request, kindly refer to the attached video for your
further viewing.

Hope to hear from you soon.

Thank you.



Henry Lee

Ding Auto Pte Ltd.

_ACCIDENT SCENE VIDEO.mp4Error! Filename not specified.

On Tue, Aug 3, 2021 at 2:08 PM Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Kenneth,

Our principal instruct to request Video from your end as your client alleged our insured of cutting in abruptly.

Kindly email us a copy of it.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

10



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy.
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 August 2021 10:25 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>; 'SA 0406' <sa0406 @dingauto.sg>
Cc: 'Accounts ( Ding Auto )' <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SJZ8544P AGAINST SBQ2383T - DOA 11/07/2021 - CHECK LIABILITY

Dear Cecilia,

Good day to you.

We would like to follow up on the liability for this case.

Thank you and we look forward to hear from you soon.

11



Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding

HP: 92313123

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, July 30, 2021 4:29 PM

To: Kenneth Ding; 'SA 0406’

Cc: 'Accounts ( Ding Auto )'

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - S1Z8544P AGAINST SBQ2383T - DOA 11/07/2021 - CHECK LIABILITY

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Kenneth,

We are pending for video footage from our insured to further investigate this matter.

Will revert back to you once investigation has been done.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy.
Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

12



Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F ISR Sl
mammmm wem Save the ELarth- Print only when necessary:

From: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 29 July 2021 2:01 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>; 'SA 0406' <sa0406@dingauto.sg>
Cc: 'Accounts ( Ding Auto )' <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SJZ8544P AGAINST SBQ2383T - DOA 11/07/2021 - CHECK LIABILITY

Dear Cecilia,

Good day to you.

We would like to follow up on the liability for this case.

Thank you and we look forward to hear from you soon.

Best Regards,

Kenneth Ding

13



HP: 92313123

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, July 27, 2021 10:11 AM

To: SA 0406

Cc: Kenneth Ding; Accounts ( Ding Auto )

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - SJZ8544P AGAINST SBQ2383T - DOA 11/07/2021 - CHECK LIABILITY

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We are pending for instruction from our principal.

Will revert back to you once instruction given.

Thanks

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

14
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From: SA 0406 [mailto:sa0406@dingauto.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 24 July 2021 4:23 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Accounts ( Ding Auto ) <accounts@dingauto.sg>
Subject: TP CLAIMS - SJZ8544P AGAINST SBQ2383T - DOA 11/07/2021 - CHECK LIABILITY

Dear Cecilia,

Good day to you.

We were informed by AIG Singapore that this case was assigned
to LKK.

Kindly refer to the attached GIA Report, Cl and TP Insurer detail
for your

further viewing.

We would like to check the liability of this case. Hope to hear from
you soon.

Thank you.
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Henry Lee
83636141
Ding Auto Pte Ltd.

Virus-free. www.avast.com
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