Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 July 2021 4:21 PM

To: 'Pauline Tham'; SUR; assignments

Cc: 'Claims Dept of CTI'

Subject: RE: SNM21D203916/C02/YN9362B/THAMYL / FW: SJW4853P and YN9362BTP

Claims, Date of Accident 13/07/2021 along 954 Hougang Ave 9 Carpark

Dear Pauline,
Noted with thanks.
No survey was done for the vehicle.

We will close this file at our end without billing.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 July, 2021 4:05 PM

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: FW: SNM21D203916/C02/YN9362B/THAMYL / FW: SJW4853P and YN9362BTP Claims, Date of Accident
13/07/2021 along 954 Hougang Ave 9 Carpark

Hi LKK
Please note that third party had withdrawn their claim.

Please let us know if any work done for our closure.

*+* Note: Please cc to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com when you reply to us.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

Thanks.

Pauline Tham
Claims Department



China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6541 | F:(65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com |  FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: ASEHfilE Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential
Information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Kon Yin Siew <KonYinSiew@goldbell.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, July 26, 2021 3:42 PM

To: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: William Oh Soon Lee <WilliamOhSL@goldbell.com.sg>; Hasrianah Binte Hassan <Hasrianah@goldbell.com.sg>;
Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>; Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>;
Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SNM21D203916/C02/YN9362B/THAMYL / FW: SJIW4853P and YN9362BTP Claims, Date of Accident
13/07/2021 along 954 Hougang Ave 9 Carpark

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Pauline,
Please be informed that the owner will withdraw the TP claim and amend the accident report to “REPORTING ONLY".

Thank you.

Kon Yin Siew | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd

GO LDB ELL Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims

e ENGINEERING DID: +65 6861 0007 | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax: +65 6863 0425 |

Industrial Vehicles. Financial Services. Mobile: +65 9739 6433 |
41,000 Served. And Counting.



