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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 19 November 2021 2:26 PM
To: 'traceyseah@gmail.com'
Subject: RE: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKK 6833K(AIG) AND SHC 2375U 

AT/ALONG TAMPINES WALK ON 17/07/2021

Dear Ms Tracey, 
 
We refer to your below email. 
Since the traffic police already issued stern warning to you which means that liability is not in your favour. We will 
proceed to resolve the matter at best to avoid further litigation, which would escalate to even more cost.  
Please be assured that we will do our due diligence to mitigate the cost. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

From: Tracey Seah <traceyseah@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 17 November 2021 12:20 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKK 6833K(AIG) AND SHC 2375U AT/ALONG TAMPINES WALK 
ON 17/07/2021 
 
Does it mean I have to assume 100% liability?  
 
On Wed, 17 Nov 2021 at 12:17 AM, Tracey Seah <traceyseah@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi, 
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Tp issued a warning to me not a 
fine 
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On Tue, 16 Nov 2021 at 2:23 PM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Ms Tracey 
  
For an update, we have received a copy of police investigation result from third party. It shows that 
traffic police have taken action against your driver for Careless Driving Causing Hurt.  
  
In view of this, we are of the view that we do not have a good defense towards the claim submitted by SHC2375U. 
We shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim at best to avoid further 
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please 
contact us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third-Party 
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD 
will be protected. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of 
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.  

  
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Friday, 23 July 2021 11:12 am 
To: traceyseah@gmail.com <traceyseah@gmail.com> 
Subject: Claim Notification - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKK 6833K(AIG) AND SHC 2375U AT/ALONG TAMPINES WALK 
ON 17/07/2021  
  
23 July 2021 
  
Ms Tracey Seah Siew Ying                                                   [By Email Only] 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: SKK6833K 
Our Ref: CC4/AIG21007754/pa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKK 6833K(AIG) AND SHC 2375U AT/ALONG TAMPINES WALK ON 17/07/2021 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your 
motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SHC2375U against your insurance policy. 
  
As discussed, we would like to request a copy of longer video footage prior to the collision for our further review. 
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Appreciate an early reply. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
19 Jul
2021
15:22

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD. Claimant's ID: -> 199303821R. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
19 Jul
2021
15:22

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(206517) HYUNDAI AE IONIQ HEV FL 1.6 DCT (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
19 Jul
2021
15:22

Clm Created
Reg No: SHC2375U. Acct Date: 2021/07/17. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. L
td. (SG). TP Insurer: AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). Workshop: ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loy
ang)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
19 Jul
2021
15:22

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
19 Jul
2021
15:22

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/07/29 [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

6
19 Jul
2021
15:22

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

7
19 Jul
2021
15:22

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (E
xpress)

[A] Merimen
Administrator

8
19 Jul
2021
15:22

Label Added (20224):Field Survey. [A] Merimen
Administrator

9
19 Jul
2021
15:22

Label Added (23):Express. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
19 Jul
2021
15:22

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> MOHD RASUL [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

11
22 Jul
2021
13:43

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

12
23 Jul
2021
10:13

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW

HSIAO TONG

13
26 Jul
2021
18:16

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

MOHD RASUL -> MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

14
01 Oct
2021
15:49

Video
Downloaded Downloaded SHC2375U VIDEO [I] Boyogan,

Joane

15
07 Dec
2021
14:59

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

16
07 Dec
2021
14:59

Clm Dtl
Modified Insured ID: -> -. Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

17
07 Dec
2021
14:59

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2019/12/19.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

18
07 Dec
2021
14:59

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

19
16 Dec
2021
13:59

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:1571.83:Liability: 50%(B14a)- Will reseek mandate if 3rd party rejected our offer.
$1,571.83
(all-in)
*3recommendation repair days + 1PH + 1Sunday + 1PRS = 6days
*For your approval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

20
16 Dec
2021
14:56

Video
Downloaded Downloaded SHC2375U VIDEO [I] Loh,

Chee-Heng

21
16 Dec
2021
15:33

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/07/29. Mandate Remarks: to settle at best for rental days. [I] Loh,
Chee-Heng

22
16 Dec
2021
15:33

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:1571.83:to settle at best for rental days. [I] Loh,

Chee-Heng

23
26 Jan
2022
13:30

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:2000.00:Hi, 3rd party propose to settle at g/s $2K(all-in) which we are of the view that it is r
easonable as traffic police take action against OI. For your comments please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

24
26 Jan
2022
13:54

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2021/07/29. Mandate Remarks: Since PIR against OI and OI was info
rmed, to settle at best if OI did not raise further concerns.

[I] Loh,
Chee-Heng

25
26 Jan
2022
13:54

Adj
Mandate Set

Approved:2000.00:Since PIR against OI and OI was informed, to settle at best if OI did not raise furth
er concerns.

[I] Loh,
Chee-Heng

26
26 Jan
2022
13:54

Video
Downloaded Downloaded SHC2375U VIDEO [I] Loh,

Chee-Heng
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AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

27
26 Jan
2022
13:54

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [I] Loh,

Chee-Heng

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go



ACTIVITY
[23/07/2021 10:52] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Spoken to OI, she said that she was driving slowly as she is not familiar to the place and she is going to turn left to the carpark. Suddenly TP
taxi just cut in from her right to make left turn. She said that maybe TP taxi saw her brake light and assume that she is going to stop then
overtake her. She will go back and check if gt longer video. OI firm that she was not moving out from stationary, she just drive very slowly
Advised her that we will also will check with TP for video footage and further discuss the matter.
[23/07/2021 10:22] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Called OI, Ms Tracey to inform TP claim. Request longer video prior collision. She needs to check and will call us back.



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2710139 19 Jul 2021
15:30:00

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SHC2375U SKK6833K 11.00

2710551 21 Jul 2021
16:20:36 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SHC2375U Teo,
Ericweihong xx.xx

2728906 29 Sep 2021
09:52:41 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SHC2375U CHEW HSIAO
TONG xx.xx

2747236 07 Dec 2021
14:59:20

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SHC2375U SKK6833K 11.00







