Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 24 September 2021 1:28 PM
To: Paul Ong Qing Yong

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); SUR
Subject: FW: SKE4040B

Attachments: SKE 4040 marked estimate.pdf
Dear Paul,

Confirmed amount $19,898.96 before excess $750 and GST @ 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 September 2021 9:34 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul.ong@wearnes.com>
Subject: SKE4040B

Hi Veron,

I've checked the finalize. Kindly assist.

Thanks.

Best Regards,



Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul.ong@wearnes.com>
Sent: Thursday, 23 September 2021 8:36 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SKE4040B

Attached the estimate for finalise

Paul Ong

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 8126 1237 D (65) 6378 9336
WEARNES

www.wearnesauto.com  paul.ong@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Paul Ong Qing Yong

Sent: Thursday, September 9, 2021 8:30 AM
To: SteveChen@lkkauto.com

Subject: SKE4040B

As mentioned.
Added in additional spraypaint for bumper beam and bracket

Paul Ong

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 8126 1237 D (65) 6378 9336
WEARNES

www.wearnesauto.com  paul.ong@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.



