Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 August 2021 2:09 PM

To: philip.cheong@cyclecarriage.com.sg

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); SUR

Subject: FW: YP 889Y-DOA: 8/7/2021

Attachments: supplement parts.pdf, SKMBT_C28421082510210.pdf; IMG-20210821-WA0004.jpg;

IMG-20210821-WA0003.jpg; IMG-20210821-WA0002.jpg

Dear Philip,

Confirmed $9562.82 before excess $750 and GST @ 7 working days.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Philip Cheong [mailto:philip.cheong@cyclecarriage.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 25 August 2021 10:40 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP 889Y-DOA: 8/7/2021

Hi Veron,

The finalize copy for your approval,

Regards

Philip

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 August 2021 5:02 pm

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Philip Cheong <philip.cheong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YP 889Y-DOA: 8/7/2021

This email was sent from outside of your organisation

Dear Philip,



Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 July 2021 11:49 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; philip.cheong@cyclecarriage.com.sg
Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: YP 889Y-DOA: 8/7/2021

Dear Philip,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle YP 889Y, (Excess $750/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741
8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*QOur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the
views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.



