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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 April 2022 10:31 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: OUR REF: M2627 SMD4575G DOA: 08/07/2021 TP CASE REQUEST 

FINALIZATION AMOUNT

CASE FINALISED 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  
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From: AutoInsure (Claims) <claims01@autoinsure.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 14 April 2022 10:23 am 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: OUR REF: M2627 SMD4575G DOA: 08/07/2021 TP CASE REQUEST FINALIZATION AMOUNT  

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 

Dear Rasul, 
 

We refer to the above matter and email below. 
 

We confirm the finalise amount at $ 3,400.00 (Before GST) on a lump sum basis and 07 repair days. 
 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

  

MH Siew 

Estimator 
  

M: (65) 9352 1129 

T: (65)  3157 2631 

E: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg 
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6 Marsiling Lane S739145 

  
t: (65) 3157 2626 

f: (65) 6368 0081 

e: enquiry@autoinsure.com.sg 

  
Website / General Enquiry / Facebook / Instagram 



2

 
 

 

On Thu, Apr 14, 2022 at 10:06 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Siew, 
  

Refer to attachment 

  

Audit checked parts prices high, necessary adjustment has to be made. 
 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of L/S $3,400.00 /- with 07 days of 

repair, subject to their approval 
 

Kindly Acknowledge 

  

 

 

From: AutoInsure (Claims) <claims01@autoinsure.com.sg> 

Sent: Monday, 11 April 2022 3:42 pm 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: OUR REF: M2627 SMD4575G DOA: 08/07/2021 TP CASE REQUEST FINALIZATION AMOUNT  

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 

Dear Rasul, 
 

We refer to the above matter. 
 

Kindly refer to our after paint photos as attached. 
 

Please let us have your confirmation finalise amount soon. 
 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

  

MH Siew 

Estimator 
  

M: (65) 9352 1129 

T: (65)  3157 2631 

E: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg 

 
Main Branch | Branch West | Branch East 
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Auto Insure Pte Ltd (Biz:201437380M) 
6 Marsiling Lane S739145 

  
t: (65) 3157 2626 

f: (65) 6368 0081 

e: enquiry@autoinsure.com.sg 

  
Website / General Enquiry / Facebook / Instagram 

 


