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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: kentsengcarservices@gmail.com

Sent: Tuesday, 17 August 2021 10:39 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Request for finalization: GBD2310Y

Dear Rasul 

 

Good day, 

 

We confirm LS COR: $5250 at 7 working days. 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards 

Sebastian 

Kent Seng Car Services 

 

On 17/8/2021 10:13 am, Rasul (LKKAuto) wrote: 

> Hi Sebastian, 

> 

> Refer to attachment for the re-finalised figure Finalised amount is $  

> 5,250 / 7 days of lump sum repair Kindly confirm 

> 

> 

> 

> 

> 

> Best Regards, 

> Rasul | Assessor 

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

> Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 Blk 51,  

> Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) Save the  

> Earth. Print only when necessary. 

> 

> -----Original Message----- 

> From: Rasul (LKKAuto) 

> Sent: Thursday, 12 August, 2021 10:02 AM 

> To: kentsengcarservices@gmail.com 

> Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 

> Subject: RE: Request for finalization: GBD2310Y 

> 

> Hi Sebastian, 

> 

> Refer to attachment 

> 

> Audit check tailgate part price a bit high. Required to be reduce. The tailgate rubber straight is $ 135.90 instead of 

149.60. 

> Finalised amount is $ 4,600 / 7 days of lump sum repair Kindly confirm 
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> 

> 

> 

> Best Regards, 

> Rasul | Assessor 

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

> Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 

| S(408933) Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

> 

> -----Original Message----- 

> From: kentsengcarservices@gmail.com  

> [mailto:kentsengcarservices@gmail.com] 

> Sent: Tuesday, 10 August, 2021 9:45 AM 

> To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 

> Subject: Re: Request for finalization: GBD2310Y 

> 

> Dear Rasul 

> 

> Good day, 

> 

> Kindly assist to finalize the case with us at your earliest convenience. 

> 

> Thank You 

> Best Regards 

> Sebastian 

> Kent Seng Car Services 

> 

> On 4/8/2021 1:02 pm, kentsengcarservices@gmail.com wrote: 

>> Dear Rasul 

>> 

>> Good day, 

>> 

>> Attachment is the after repair photo of GBD2310Y for your perusal. 

>> 

>> Kindly assist to finalize the case with us at your earliest convenience. 

>> 

>> Thank You 

>> Best Regards 

>> Sebastian 

>> Kent Seng Car Services 

 


