8/24/2021 Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

RE: Finalize SMX 6603 R - DOA: 10/07/2021

James <jamestan@oohrayrental.com.sg>
Tue 24/8/2021 8:45 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Cc: jerleen@oohrayrental.com.sg <jerleen@oohrayrental.com.sg>

Dear Denise,
We accept COR P/P $3755.70.
Thanks

Regards
James Tan

OOHRAY RENTAL PTE LTD

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier@Kaki Bukit #06-31 Singapore 415875
Tel: (65) 6661 9687 Fax: (65) 6241 6697

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: 23 August 2021 10:52

To: James; Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: jerleen@oohrayrental.com.sg

Subject: Re: Finalize SMX 6603 R - DOA: 10/07/2021

Hi James,

i got the same amount as you, therefore finalise amount at $3755.70,4days.

Please confirm the same.

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: James <jamestan@oohrayrental.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 20 August 2021 4:46 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>; jerleen@oohrayrental.com.sg
<jerleen@oohrayrental.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Finalize SMX 6603 R - DOA: 10/07/2021
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Dear Taufikh,

Your calculation i think got mistake.
My calculation is $3755.70.
Can you re-calculate again?

Regards
James Tan

OOHRAY RENTAL PTE LTD
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier@Kaki Bukit #06-31 Singapore 415875
Tel: (65) 6661 9687 Fax: (65) 6241 6697

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Sent: 20 August 2021 12:48

To: James

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalize SMX 6603 R - DOA: 10/07/2021

Hi James.
Refer attached, COR$3732.60, 4 DAYS.

Regards,
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: James [mailto:jamestan@oohrayrental.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 18 August 2021 3:16 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Finalize SMX 6603 R - DOA: 10/07/2021

Dear Denise,
Cannot confirm. I’ve ask taufikh to readjust the pricing and some parts.

Regards
James Tan

OOHRAY RENTAL PTE LTD
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier@Kaki Bukit #06-31 Singapore 415875
Tel: (65) 6661 9687 Fax: (65) 6241 6697

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: 18 August 2021 12:53

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); James

Subject: Re: Finalize SMX 6603 R - DOA: 10/07/2021

Dear James,

Can confirm?
COR $3606.28, 4 days.
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Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 17 August 2021 12:11 PM

To: 'James' <jamestan@oohrayrental.com.sg>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalize SMX 6603 R - DOA: 10/07/2021

Hi James,
Refer attached, COR $3606.28, 4 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: James [mailto:jamestan@oohrayrental.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 10 August 2021 11:06 AM

To: Summer (LKK Auto); Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: jerleen@oohrayrental.com.sg

Subject: Finalize SMX 6603 R - DOA: 10/07/2021

Dear All,
Please kindly assist to finalize the above mention case. Urgent.
Thanks.

Regards
James Tan

OOHRAY RENTAL PTE LTD
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier@Kaki Bukit #06-31 Singapore 415875
Tel: (65) 6661 9687 Fax: (65) 6241 6697
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