Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Auburn Auto <auburnauto.insurance@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 26 August 2021 9:14 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SKE 3750S -DOA: 8/7/21

Dear Veron,

We already sent LOD to EQ.

Kindly address the cheque to: AUBURN AUTO PTE LTD
Mail to: 176 Sin Ming Drive (AutoCare) #04-18, Singapore 575721

Thanks and Best Regards

Claims Dept
90938998

On Tue, Aug 24, 2021 at 2:32 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 1 S(408933)



