Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: SA 0406 <sa0406@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Monday, 12 July 2021 10:52 AM

To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey

Cc: Kenneth Ding; Accounts ( Ding Auto )

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: TP CLAIMS - SMX8579P AGAINST GBG2854D - DOA: 10/07/2021 -

CHECK LIABILITY & ARRANGE VEHICLE SURVEY

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear AIG Motor Claims Officer,

As per earlier email, vehicle survey can be arrange anytime after
10.00am tomorrow.

Thank you.

Henry Lee
Ding Auto Pte Ltd.

On Mon, Jul 12, 2021 at 10:36 AM SA 0406 <sa0406(@dingauto.sg> wrote:

Dear AIG Motor Claims Officer,

Good day to you.

Kindly refer to the attached GIA Report, Cl, TP Insurer detail and
accident
photos for your further viewing.

We would like to check liability of this case and arrange vehicle
survey at
our workshop :

Ding Auto Pte Ltd
176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06



Singapore 575721

Hope to hear from you soon.
Thank you.

Henry Lee

83636141
Ding Auto Pte Ltd



