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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Soon Hoo Loo <soonhoo@lioncityrentals.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 May 2023 2:34 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: jasonlauzh@lioncityrentals.com.sg; siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg; SUR

Subject: Re: Vehicle SLN2366R, DOA: 08/07/2021, finalize repair costs

PROPERTY CLAIM 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

TO : ANY PERSONAL INJURY 

CLAIMS 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

We are pleased to inform you that we are agreeable to your proposed repair cost of $4,850.00 (before GST) at 5 working days for vehicle 
number SLN2366R. 

Thank you. 

  

Regards, 

Loo Soon Hoo 

Lion City Rentals Pte Ltd 

 

On Fri, May 26, 2023 at 4:23 PM Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of Lump Sum $4,850.00 with 5 days of repair , subject to their approval. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Saturday, July 24, 2021 10:51 AM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: 转发: Vehicle SLN2366R, DOA: 08/07/2021, finalize repair costs 

  

  

发件人: Zhe Hao Lau <jasonlauzh@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 

已发送: 2021年 7月 24日 10:50:36 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 

收件人: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 

抄送: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 

主题: Vehicle SLN2366R, DOA: 08/07/2021, finalize repair costs 

Dear Guo Qiang,  

  

Enclosed are the estimate and after paint photos for vehicle SLN2366R.  
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 This vehicle finalize repair costs will be $5700.00 lump sum with 5 working days and will await for your approval.  

  

Thank you.  

 

  

Regards,  

Jason 

ARC Executive 

6955 9331 

60 Jalan Lam Huat, 

#04-39/40 Carros Centre 

Singapore 737869 


