Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 8 July, 2021 2:23 PM

To: vy Ratilla’; 'SUR’; 'assignments'

Cc: 'Charandeep Singh'; 'Derrick Quok’; 'Kenneth Lim'

Subject: RE: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10010798/CD || OI-SLQ8637D (Blue) TP-SKF645C || Est:
$ || AT Auto

Dear lvy,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: lvy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 8 July, 2021 2:11 PM

To: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; 'assignments’
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok <derrick.q@budgetdirect.com.sg>;
Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10010798/CD || OI-SLQ8637D (Blue) TP-SKF645C || Est: S || AT Auto

Hi Team,
We would like to arrange TP survey for SKF645C. TP chose Mr. Kenneth Kong to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:

Alan Tan

83868989

Vehicle in at Blk 1 Sin Ming Industrial Sector C # 01-135

Please confirm. Thank you.

Regards,

Ivy Ratilla

Admin Executive, Claims
T +65 6540 2185

F +65 6725 0853

E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199
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Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924
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auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

From: Tan Alan <atautoconsultant@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 8 July 2021 10:50 AM

To: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVED WITH YOUR INSURED SLQ8637D 7 OUR CLIENT'S VEHICLE SKF645C ALONG PIE
TOWARDS CHANGI ON 06.07.2021 || C10010798

Hi lvy,

We are agreeable to select Kenneth from LKK as the SJE for above case.
** Vehicle in at Blk 1 Sin Ming Industrial Sector C # 01-135.

Thank you

Rgds
Alan
A T Auto Consultant

From: Tan Alan <atautoconsultant@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 July 2021 1:10 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVED WITH YOUR INSURED SLQ8637D 7 OUR CLIENT'S VEHICLE SKF645C ALONG PIE
TOWARDS CHANGI ON 06.07.2021

Hi Sir,

Attached herewith the Notification Of Accident for your reference.



Kindly let us have a list of your ten surveyors as your nominated SJE for our consideration within the
stipulated timeline under the NIMA Protocol.

Rgds

Alan Tan

83868989

AT Auto Consultant
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