Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 18 March 2022 3:56 pm

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: SNM21D203771/C02/SLD1579C/THAMYL / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident

Involving SLD1579C (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND GBL3018T (TP : LKK REF -
CCo6/CTI21007425/Ara3) on 03/07/2021

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 December 2021 8:16 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM21D203771/C02/SLD1579C/THAMYL / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLD1579C (Ol : CTI -
TBA) AND GBL3018T (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI21007425/Ara3) on 03/07/2021

Hi Jaslin

Our proposed max offer as follows
Cor : $4066.00

Lou : $750 (5days x $150)

Search: $7.45

Total : $4823.45

Thanks.

** Note: Please cc to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com when you reply to us.

NOTICE :



In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

Thanks.

Pauline Tham
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6541 | F:(65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A 3Jifits Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, October 22, 2021 1:07 PM

To: Angie Foo <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: FW: SNM21D203771/C02/SLD1579C/THAMYL / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLD1579C (Ol : CTI -
TBA) AND GBL3018T (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI121007425/Ara3) on 03/07/2021

Angie Foo

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896186 | F:(65) 62247175 | F:(65)6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: KE3ifiis Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, October 22, 2021 10:56 AM

To: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SNM21D203771/C02/SLD1579C/THAMYL / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLD1579C (Ol : CTI -
TBA) AND GBL3018T (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI21007425/Ara3) on 03/07/2021

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.



Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We seek your approval to offer repairer “MG SOLUTION PTE LTD" at $ 4,973.45(all-in).

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair $8,112.62 $4,066.00 ($3,800.00+ 7%GST)
2. Loss of Use (5days x $300.00) $1,500.00 $900.00 (5 days x $180.00)
3. LTA / GIA Search Fee $7.45 $7.45

Surveyor recommended 4 days for repair + 1PRS = 5 DAYS

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Saturday, September 4, 2021 1:53 AM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>




