Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Tio Jia Hao <jiahao@eurosportsauto.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 27 October 2021 1:13 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: SNA 989B-DOA: 3/7/21

Hi Veron,

My apologies on the delay, we still pending invoice from our contractor to finalise the repair amount.
Will submit you the necessary documents asap once completed.
Thanks and have a great day!

Warm Regards,
Jia Hao.

Lamborghini Singapore g

EuroSports Auto Pte Ltd
24, Leng Kee Rd #08-02
Singapore 159096

Tel(HP) 1 +65 9799 9593

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 October 2021 2:13 pm

To: Tio Jia Hao <jiahao@eurosportsauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SNA 989B-DOA: 3/7/21

Dear Jia Hao,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 October 2021 10:34 AM

To: Tio Jia Hao <jiahao@eurosportsauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SNA 989B-DOA: 3/7/21

Dear Jia Hao,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tio Jia Hao [mailto:jiahao@eurosportsauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 11 August 2021 12:31 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SNA 989B-DOA: 3/7/21

Hi Veron,
The vehicle still undergoing repair at PACC, delay on the parts hence take longer.
Thank you,

Warm Regards,
Jia Hao.

Lamborghini Singapore E

EuroSports Auto Pte Ltd
24, Leng Kee Rd #08-02
Singapore 159096

Tel(HP) 1 +65 9799 9593

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 11 August 2021 11:29 am




To: Tio Jia Hao <jiahao@eurosportsauto.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SNA 989B-DOA: 3/7/21

Dear Jia Hao,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



