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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: MS Car Auto <mscarautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 November 2021 10:49 AM

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Finalisation of FBG 2610R

Yes, please proceed.  
THANKS 
 
 
 
Warmest Regards, 
Desmond Ng 

MS Car Auto Pte Ltd 
 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07 

Premier @ Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 415875 
Telephone: 6385-1838 
Fax :          6386-1838 
 
 
On Wed, Nov 24, 2021 at 10:47 AM TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Desmond, 

  

Attached is the adjusted estimate of FBG 2610R 

  

Recommended COR is NV $ 1400.00 with 3 repair days, subjected to the approval of the insurance company. 

Please confirm your acceptance of our COR offer and send the LOD and all the necessary documents to our 
Case Handler Ms Veron Chen ASAP. 

  

Please take note the the LS of $ 1,450 is higher than the NV.  

Therefore NV of $1,400.00 is offered as the recommended COR. 
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Best Regards, 

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants 

Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  TeowGuan@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


