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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 August 2021 11:09 AM

To: SUR; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ESTIMATE FOR SJM6750S

Dear Veron, 
 
Sorry for the late reply. 
 
We accept COR at lump sum $2,000 (before GST) and 4 days. 
 
Warmest regards, 
Steven 
Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd 
82636295 
 
 
On Wednesday, 18 August 2021, 05:05:35 pm SGT, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:  
 
 

Dear Steven, 

  

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Kindly confirmed Lump Sum $2000 @ 4 days 

  

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

From: Thiam Heng Huat [mailto:thh176@yahoo.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 18 August 2021 4:27 PM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ESTIMATE FOR SJM6750S 

  

Hi Veron, 

  

Estimate for your attention. 

  

Warmest regards, 

Steven 

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd 

82636295 


