Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Darryl Quek <darrylquek@tkqp.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 8 July 2021 2:17 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Constance Pang on behalf of Teo Weng Kie; assignments

Cc: daniel@dpco.com.sg; 'Siti Awiyah'; Teo Weng Kie

Subject: RE: [SJE REPORT] Yref: TBA \\  Oref: (V)TWK/DAQ/pkf/1027.20 - MC/MC 4722/2020
- Accident involving SJP 3859S and SU 6000A on 21.11.19 along Tanglin Road

Attachments: SU6000A COE.pdf; SUG000A MV.pdf

Dear Veron,
Please find enclosed the requested documents.
Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Darryl Quek
Associate

Note: In view of the current COVID-19 situation, we have adopted a telecommuting policy for our department. In the
circumstances, kindly direct all communications to us via email with immediate effect. If you need to speak to me,
please reach me at my work mobile as stated below.

TKQP

Tan Kok Quan Partnership

Advocates & Solicitors, Singapore

1 Wallich Street #07-02 Guoco Tower Singapore 078881
T (65) 6225 9333

D (65) 6496 9590

M (65) 9846 1487

F (65) 6225 0111

E darrylguek@tkgp.com.sg

W www.tkgp.com.sg

This email is intended solely for the abovenamed addressee(s). It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. If this email has reached you in error, please
delete it immediately and inform us of the error. Thank you for your co-operation.

Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information can be intercepted, corrupted, lost, or it may arrive late or contain viruses. The sender
therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message which arise as a result of Internet transmission.

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 7, 2021 5:05 PM

To: Constance Pang on behalf of Teo Weng Kie <constancepang@tkqgp.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: daniel@dpco.com.sg; 'Siti Awiyah' <siti@dpco.com.sg>; Teo Weng Kie <teowengkie@tkqp.com.sg>; Darryl Quek
<darrylquek@tkqp.com.sg>



Subject: FW: [SJE REPORT] Yref: TBA \\ Oref: (V)TWK/DAQ/pkf/1027.20 - MC/MC 4722/2020 - Accident involving SJP
3859S and SU 6000A on 21.11.19 along Tanglin Road

CAUTION:External email — beware of unsafe links or attachments.

Dear Weng Kie,

Our surveyor would like to request documents proof from AJAX MV $20000 and LTA rebate $6415.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Sunday, 4 July 2021 3:00 PM

To: Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@Ikkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: [SJE REPORT] Yref: TBA \\ Oref: (V)TWK/DAQ/pkf/1027.20 - MC/MC 4722/2020 - Accident involving SJP
3859S and SU 6000A on 21.11.19 along Tanglin Road

Dear Marcus / Veron,

FYNA paper survey done, document upload in views.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 2 July, 2021 4:59 PM

To: 'Constance Pang on behalf of Teo Weng Kie' <constancepang@tkqgp.com.sg>; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: daniel@dpco.com.sg; 'Siti Awiyah' <siti@dpco.com.sg>; 'Teo Weng Kie' <teowengkie@tkgp.com.sg>; 'Darryl Quek'
<darrylquek@tkgp.com.sg>




Subject: RE: [SJE REPORT] Yref: TBA \\ Oref: (V)TWK/DAQ/pkf/1027.20 - MC/MC 4722/2020 - Accident involving SJP
3859S and SU 6000A on 21.11.19 along Tanglin Road

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Thank you for your assignment.

Please sign and return to us, before we proceed the paper survey.

Kindly chop and sign the Service Request Form and forward back to me to enable us to proceed

with Paper Survey.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Constance Pang on behalf of Teo Weng Kie <constancepang@tkgp.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 2 July, 2021 4:32 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: daniel@dpco.com.sg; Siti Awiyah <siti@dpco.com.sg>; Teo Weng Kie <teowengkie@tkgp.com.sg>; Darryl Quek
<darrylquek@tkgp.com.sg>

Subject: [SIE REPORT] Yref: TBA \\ Oref: (V)TWK/DAQ/pkf/1027.20 - MC/MC 4722/2020 - Accident involving SIP 3859S
and SU 6000A on 21.11.19 along Tanglin Road

Importance: High

LKK Automobile Appraisers
Singapore BY EMAIL ONLY

Attention: Mr Chua Kang Seng

Dear Mr Chua,
We refer to the above matter.

We act for the Defendant, the driver of motor vehicle no. SJP 3859S and M/s Daniel Poon & Co act for the Plaintiff, the
owner and driver of SU 6000A.

Please be informed that the Court has appointed you as the Single Joint Expert for this action to provide an independent
assessment in respect of costs of repairs for motor car no. SU 6000A. We forward herewith copies of the following
documents:-

(a) Plaintiff’s survey report from Autoprobe Consultants dated 2 January 2020 together with the coloured
photographs;



(b) Defendant’s survey report from AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd dated 16 January 2010 together with the
coloured photographs;

(c) Repair bill from Serve You Motor Service;

(d) GIA report and Traffic police of the Defendant; and

(e) GIA report and traffic police report of the Plaintiff

for your necessary action.

Kindly note that as a Single Joint Expert appointed by the Court, your primary duty is to the Court and you are required to
give a fair and reasonable assessment of costs of repairs for SU 6000A.

Please let us have your assessment report and your invoice for fees for preparing the same as soon as possible.
Note: In view of the current COVID-19 situation, we have adopted a telecommuting policy. In the circumstances, kindly direct all

communications to us via email with immediate effect. If you email me, please copy my secretary Ms Constance Pang at
constancepang@tkqp.com.sqg You may also contact me at my business mobile @ 9847 5103 during office hours.

Kind Regards,

Teo Weng Kie
Partner

Head of Department
Insurance

encs

TKQP

Tan Kok Quan Partnership

Advocates & Solicitors, Singapore

1 Wallich Street #07-02 Guoco Tower Singapore 078881
T (65) 6225 9333

D (65) 6496 9527

F (65) 6227 6116

E teowengkie@tkgp.com.sg

W www.tkgp.com.sg

This email is intended solely for the abovenamed addressee(s). It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information. If this email has reached you in error, please
delete it immediately and inform us of the error. Thank you for your co-operation.

Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secured or error-free as information can be intercepted, corrupted, lost, or it may arrive late or contain viruses. The sender
therefore does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message which arise as a result of Internet transmission.




