Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 29 July 2021 10:25 AM

To: SUR

Subject: FW: TP CLAIM YOUR REF SNM21D203681/C02/SMX9166R
Attachments: SKJ8989L LOD AND FINAL BILL _000057.pdf
CS/CTI21007256/Dvc

Hi

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Alfred Quah [mailto:alfredautoss@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 28 July 2021 11:36 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jenny Lew <jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: TP CLAIM YOUR REF SNM21D203681/C02/SMX9166R

[WITHOUT PREJUDICE SAVE AS TO COSTS]

DEAR SIRS

On 07/07/2021 your surveyors LKK AUTO have survey our client vehicle SKI8989L
We are open to direct & amicable settlement .

Attach LETTER OF DEMAND

Kindly let us have your offer .



Please also note that you or your insurer should send us an acknowledgement of this letter within 7 working
days of your receipt of this letter ,failing which our client will have no alternative but to commence proceedings
without further notice to you or your insurer .

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Alfred QUAH (Mr)

Alfred Auto Services & Supplies

ACRA: 391089/00E

HP/WhatsApp: 9145-4773

Tel: 6483-4586

Fax: 6483-4882

Email: alfredautoss @ gmail.com

Address: 5035 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2, #01-351,
Singapore 569538




