
10/8/21, 10:59 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAQkAGNlMTQ1ODBhLTc0NjYtNGE3OC05NWVkLTMyZWUwMGFhNWIxNAAQAKNHCPPh30thgBuSad… 1/3

Fw: TPPD Survey Report || C10008026 || Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SJV 1401K
Ref: C10008026/ST

Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Fri 8/10/2021 10:58 AM
To:  Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Cc:  SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

 

Dear Charan,

Please see re-submit report with MV indicated

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, 18 September 2021 12:37 pm

To: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Reports (LKKAuto) <report@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TPPD Survey Report || C10008026 || Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SJV 1401K Ref:
C10008026/ST
 
Dear Charan
 
Vehicle registered in 2010 and its COE was extended till 2024. COR recommended is $3,550/-.
 
Internally, we have SOP to check the MV for all cases however we will only indicate the MV in SR if the
repair cost is above specific range and/or if the vehicles are nearing the end of their COE lifespan
regardless of whether insurer request. There are also insurers who had previously given us standing
request to indicate MV in the SR for all their cases and so far, BDI is not one of them.
 
If you require the MV for all BDI cases, please advise and I will pass down the message to my
colleagues to indicate the MV in SR henceforth.  
 
Dear Denise
 
Please re-submit report with MV indicated.
 
Our ref: CS3/AGI20012996/T1tf3e2-1
 
Best Regards,
Bryan Ang
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Sent: Saturday, 18 September 2021 12:13 PM

To: Reports (LKKAuto) <report@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto)
<hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TPPD Survey Report || C10008026 || Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SJV 1401K Ref:
C10008026/ST
 
Dear LKK Team,
 
I saw your report and I am disappointed that you have made no mention of the economical repair limit but
recommended lump sum repair.
 
Please provide me the economical repair limit of the third-party vehicle urgently.
 
 
Regards,
 
Charan
Executive, Claims
 
T +65 6540 2186
F +65 6725 0853 
E Charandeep.S@budgetdirect.com.sg
 

 
 
Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore
239924                                                                                                                                 
budgetdirect.com.sg
 

 
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.
 
 
 
 
 
From: Elaine (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 28 July 2021 5:07 PM

To: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>
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Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)'
<hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SJV 1401K Ref: C10008026/ST
 
Dear Ivy,
 
 
Enclose Survey Report of  SJV 1401K.
 
 
Thank you.
 
 
Best Regards,

Elaine | Reports
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.
Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111   Fax: 6741-4108   email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933
 
 
This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte.
Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended
addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but
may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If
you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference
with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify
the sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.
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