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Re: FINALIZE FOR SLR 4464G DOA 26/06/2021

Fulco Autocare Pte Ltd <fulco0302@gmail.com>
Mon 16/8/2021 10:21 AM
To:  Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Dear Denise,

We confirm the COR at lump sum $12,300 (before GST) and 21 days.

Best Regards,

Fulco Autocare Pte Ltd

On Mon, Aug 16, 2021 at 7:23 AM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,


Any updates on the finalise amount?


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 August 2021 9:24 AM

To: fulco0302@gmail.com <fulco0302@gmail.com>

Subject: FINALIZE FOR SLR 4464G DOA 26/06/2021
 




Hi,



Finalise offer at lump sum $12,300, 21days.


Please check and revert back on confirmation 


Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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