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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 20 June 2022 10:54 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: Quotation - Vehicle Fire Investigation

Hello Shiau Chan  

 

You can bill by this amount stated in the email. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Sherwin Beh | Technical Investigator 

LKK Auto Consultants 

Office: 6256 3561  | Email:  SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 14 June 2021 12:15 pm 

To: Mohamad Azman Bin Rani <mohamad.rani@sembcorp.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Investigation 

<investigation@lkkauto.com>; Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto) <SherwinBeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Quotation - Vehicle Fire Investigation  

  

Hi Azman 

  
I will be assigning this case to my colleague Sherwin, who is copied in this email. 
  
Our fees for a technical analysis on the cause of fire will be $500/- excluding gst. 
  
Please make arrangement with Sherwin for the inspection of the vehicle. 
  

Best Regards, 

Bryan Ang  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Mohamad Azman Bin Rani <mohamad.rani@sembcorp.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 10 June 2021 5:16 PM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Investigation <investigation@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Quotation - Vehicle Fire Investigation 

  

Dear Bryan, 

  

Appreciate your updates. 

  

Thanks 

Regards 

Mohamad Azman 
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From: Mohamad Azman Bin Rani  

Sent: Wednesday, June 9, 2021 5:57 PM 

To: sur@lkkauto.com 

Subject: Quotation - Vehicle Fire Investigation 

  

Dear Bryan, 

  

We refer to above subject. 

Please quote us at best. 

1. Main causes of the fire 

2. Preventive measure. 

  

Thanks 

Regards 
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Mohamad Azman Bin Rani 
Senior Executive 
Vehicle Workshop 
SembWaste Pte Ltd 
4543 Jalan Bukit Merah, Singapore 
DID :68546248 
FAX :62759943 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  
This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it and notify 
us immediately. You should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Thank 
you.  


