Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 30 July 2021 11:50 AM

To: ppemclaims@gmail.com

Cc: jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg;
andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBJ5830L OD INDIA FINALIZE - DOA: 25/06/2021

Hi Ezel,

COR I/s$6000, 8 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: ppemclaims@gmail.com [mailto:ppemclaims@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 9 July 2021 2:44 PM

To: 'Taufikh (LKK Auto)'

Cc: jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg; andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg
Subject: GB]J5830L OD INDIA FINALIZE - DOA: 25/06/2021

Hi Taufikh,

We will undertake the repair of this vehicle @ COR L/S $6,000.00 (before GST & excess) & 8 repair days.
Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ezel Tejano

Accident Claim Officer

+65 8721 3003 | ezel @panpacificleasing.com.sg

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop)
56 Loyang Way, #06-07,Loyang Enterprise Building, Singapore 508775

** As of 1 May 2020, For all Accident Claims related matters, Please email to ppemclaims @ gmail.com



