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Re: Fw: Finalisation of SJS 7947D

Management Assist <management@assist.com.sg>
Wed 7/14/2021 11:39 AM
To:  Hui Zhen (LKK Auto) <huizhen@lkkauto.com>

Hi Hui,

Yes we confirm-will send the LOD later today.


Best Regards,
Ray T
Accident Assist SG
24 Sin Ming Lane
#01-94 Midview City
Singapore 573930
ROC: 53375754
Tel: 63341182 
Fax: 63341582


On Wed, 14 Jul 2021 at 10:54, Hui Zhen (LKK Auto) <huizhen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ray,


Can confirm?




Best Regards,

Hui Zhen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: huizhen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, July 12, 2021 3:34 PM

To: Traffic Reconstruction <management@assist.com.sg>

Cc: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto) <huizhen@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Finalisation of SJS 7947D
 
Without Prejudice
 
Hi Ray,
 
Attached is the adjusted estimate of SJS 7947D
 
Recommended COR is LS $ 5050.00 with 10 repair days, subjected to the approval of the insurance
company.
Please send the LOD and all the necessary documents to our Case Handler Ms Hui Zhen ASAP>
 
 
Best Regards,
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TG Lim | Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants
Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  TeowGuan@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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