Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 23 September 2021 12:59 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: LKK REF : CC6/AIG21007090/Ugs3
Attachments: SMV1414M LOD.pdf

Dear Cecilia,

Please let us have your offer to settle .

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 12 July 2021 2:40 PM

To: 'Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)' <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>; 'Su Li (LKK Auto)' <suli@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP Survey: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX8487H, SMV1414M .AND SCP8001A ON 27/06/2021 LKK REF :
CC6/AIG21007090/Ugs3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Cecilia

We submit our claim as follow :

Repair cost $$1786.21
Loss of use SS 100.00 ( @5$100 per day for 2000cc car)

Please let us have your offer to settle

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd
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i. - ifie, () \—o\ S W~ S the owner of vehicle Regisiration
Number .S YW | L £ VRave been advised by them and undersiand the content of my/our motor

claim as specify herein:
Type of Claim: [~ | Claim Own-policy only

%iﬁct ettlement with 3™ Party Insurer

A A Compulsory policy excess. Stated in Motor Policy talken up by you, is applicable for
own damage claim.

s You have myfour full auvtherity to negotiate a settlement with the third party andfor histher/their
insurers on such terms as you deem fit. Upon setilement of my/owr claim, you are suthorised to sign any

Discharge Voucher or any document to confirm my/our accepiance of the settlement as full and final
discharge of myfour claim, on mw/our b

: Eoss of Use and Cost of Rental shall be computed in accordance to the number of days as

recommended by the surve yo and the Benchmark Rates pubiished in State Court Practice Direction for
Non-injury Motor Accideni (NIMA YClaim
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/We, am/are fully aware that Jin Auto Services Pre Lid is assisting me/as in my/oar third party
insurer, Ifwe shall release Jin Avto Service Pte Lid against any liability, 1oss claim or proceedings which
may arise out of or in the course of or by reason of execution of the services. :
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T ’G whatever reason, my/our insurers reject myvounr claim for indemnity for the cost of repairs and/or
er losses recoverable under the policy of insurance or make an offer to pay less than the amount

laimed b}' vou, Ifwe agree and underiake to pay the full amount of your repair bifl and survey fees and
an 5 C‘LneL expenses raasmabi ¥ incurred on my/sur behalf or to pay you the difference in amount, as the

av be.

! In the evem that my/our insurer or third party insurer is not prepared {0 setile claim due to breach o
policy or other reasons, Iiwe shall pay Jin Auto Services Pte Lid the full repair bill.




RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop) hereby confirm that we/I have reached
an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S$1,786.22
(Repair Cost), $$90.00 (Loss of Use/Rental), S§ - (Disbursement) for vehicle no. SMV 1414M that
was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 27/06/2021 (date) along/at PIE
TOWARDS TAMPINES 30M BEFORE EXIT 8B (location) involving vehicle no/s SCP 8001A.
This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 28/06/2021 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/I confirm that we/I are/am authorized by the owner RITA SHARMA (“the third party claimant™)
of vehicle no. SMV_1414M make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/I have full
authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/I enclose herein the
letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SMV
1414M (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this 8th (day) of __Oct (month) 2021 (year)

@ Cxg

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the%lorkshop” (with chop)
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N.B No responsibility will be accepted for any loss or
damage to any Vehicles or parts left in this workshop
for any reason whatsoever.
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 2 July 2021 2:20 PM

To: mwmdeutz@yahoo.com

Subject: <STANDARD NOTIFICATION LETTER> OUR REF: CC6/AIG21007090/Ugs3 *** ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SCP 8001A / SMV 1414M / OTHERS ON 27/06/2021 ***

Our Ref: CC6/AIG21007090/Ugs3
02 JULY 2021

TAN KIM SENG

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCP 8001A / SMV 1414M / OTHERS ON 27/06/2021

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your Motor Insurer (AlG
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance
policy taken up with them.

This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SMV 1414M.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given us
your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for
an amicable settlement with third party claimant

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) will be with held for the time being. Pending for final
allocation of liability in settlement by our principal AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.

Please call us if you have further queries.

c.C. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be
made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any
inconvenience caused is much regretted.



Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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10/7/21, 3:17 PM Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SMV1414M (5052339100SG)
[SCP8001A]
TP
RITA SHARMA
Jun 27 2021 11:00AM
[Tan Kim Seng]
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 05/10/2021 16:35
PM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$1886.22) - SMV1414M - Claim Handler: Goh, Jeremy-CX

Approved:1886.22:mandate approved. settle at best. subject to documents in order.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=88450921&CFTOKEN=386baef1811abdcb-7B36F3... 1/1



