2/21/22,11:15 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

FW: SKX 1014Y DOA : 25/06/21

Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Wed 16/2/2022 5:22 PM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Hi Denise,

Case finalised

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
F ESES
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From: Admin AP Automotive Services [mailto:mota@apautomotive.services]
Sent: Wednesday, 16 February, 2022 2:44 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Juliana .; Marcus Teo; info; Paul Ho; ClickUp: SKX 1014Y

Subject: Re: SKX 1014Y DOA : 25/06/21

Dear Rasul
We are pleased to accept the finalised amount given as at $3,500 with 5 days repair
Will forward LOD in a while

Best regards,

Juliana

AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd
ROC: 202022890H

BLK 9006 TAMPINES ST 93

#01-202 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A
SINGAPORE 528840

TEL: 6970 4786 FAX: 6787 4886

On Thu, 3 Feb 2022 at 10:54, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@]lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Zaleha,

So sorry we unable to increase the amount.
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Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Admin AP Automotive Services [mailto:mota@apautomotive.services]
Sent: Saturday, 29 January, 2022 9:29 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SKX 1014Y DOA : 25/06/21

Hi Rasul,
Can it close at $3800?

Best regards,

Zaleha

AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd
ROC: 202022890H

BLK 9006 TAMPINES ST 93

#01-202 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A
SINGAPORE 528840

TEL: 6970 4786 FAX: 6787 4886

On Thu, 27 Jan 2022 at 12:03, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Zaleha,

Can offer at 3500

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
F L7
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From: Admin AP Automotive Services [mailto:mota@apautomotive.services]
Sent: Wednesday, 26 January, 2022 3:12 PM
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To: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SKX 1014Y DOA : 25/06/21

Hi Rasul,
Can we close at $4,000.00 and 5 repair days?
Best regards,

Zaleha

AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd
ROC: 202022890H

BLK 9006 TAMPINES ST 93

#01-202 TAMPINES INDUSTRIAL PARK A
SINGAPORE 528840

TEL: 6970 4786 FAX: 6787 4886

On Mon, 17 Jan 2022 at 12:08, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@]lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Zaleha,

Kindly acknowledge

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
57474
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 January, 2022 9:46 AM
To: Admin AP Automotive Services

Subject: SKX 1014Y DOA : 25/06/21

Hi Zaleha,

Kindly refer to attachment

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $3,350 /- with 5 days of lump sum
repair, subject to their approval
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Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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