Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: James Chew <jameschew88@outlook.com>

Sent: Monday, 5 July, 2021 7:36 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: TP claim against your insured SKW814S *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21007080/ra3
Categories: HMK

From both sketch plans, it was a collision at the turn. So most likely it is going to be 50-507?

James Chew

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, July 5, 2021 6:51:46 PM

To: James Chew <jameschew88@outlook.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: TP claim against your insured SKW814S *** KK REF: CC4/A1G21007080/ra3

WITHOUT PRE]JUDICE

Dear James

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear.

Kindly advise if there is any substantial evidence from your client. If so, kindly forward to us.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: James Chew <jameschew88@outlook.com>

Sent: Monday, July 5, 2021 11:32 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: TP claim against your insured SKW814S *** KK REF: CC4/AIG21007080/ra3

Hi All,
Pls let me know if there is any update on liability so | can update my client? Thank you.

James Chew



From: James Chew <jameschew88@outlook.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 30, 2021 1:27:52 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: TP claim against your insured SKW814S *** KK REF: CC4/AIG21007080/ra3

Hi Jaslin,
Any update on the liability?

James Chew

From: James Chew <jameschew88@outlook.com>

Sent: Monday, June 28, 2021 2:51:16 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assighments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: TP claim against your insured SKW814S *** KK REF: CC4/AIG21007080/ra3

OK thanks for the information.
Could I check with Jaslin on the liability of this case and possible to let me know soon? Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, June 28, 2021 2:25:09 PM

To: jameschew88@outlook.com <jameschew88@outlook.com>

Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assighments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP claim against your insured SKW814S *** KK REF: CC4/AIG21007080/ra3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.
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Please provide us the following and arrange for survey.
® evidencei.e. video (if any)
e PIR result (if any)
e Estimated cost of repair

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Jaslin.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: James Chew <jameschew88@outlook.com>
Sent: Saturday, June 26, 2021 11:23 AM
To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey <AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] TP claim against your insured SKW814S
3




This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Hi,

We would be filing a TP claim against your insured for the accident on 15/5/2021. Our client is SLS2938P. Could |
check with you on the liability of this case? Thank you.

James Chew

Soon Seng Company (SG) Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-05

S(575722)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



