Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 November 2021 5:02 pm

To: Boo seng yak; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Carrine Leong;
jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SLE6126M - OD AIG - SURVEYED 25 JUN 21

Hi Mr.Boo,

Finalize COR $7244.8 before GST @ 4 days.
COR subject to insurance approval.

Regards,
Guo Qiang

From: Boo seng yak [mailto:boojohnny@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 20 August, 2021 5:33 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); SUR; Carrine Leong; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing; Guo Qiang
(LKKAuto)

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SLE6126M - OD AIG - SURVEYED 25 JUN 21

Hi Guo Qiang and all,
Revised estimate and photographs is attached.
Please confirm repair cost of $7244.80 @ 4 days.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - Johnny Boo



