Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 3:32 pm
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SKV8206A - Finalise

Dear Shiau Chan,
We confirmed lump sum repair at $2,500.00 with 5days of repair.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vronica Law

City Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate,
#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road,
Singapore 575643

Tel : 6453 1235

Fax : 6453 7944

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 18 October 2021 4:09 pm

To: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SKV8206A - Finalise

Dear Vronica,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

As spoken with you.

Offer Lump Sum $2,500.00 and 5 repair days.

Kindly check and confirm.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 18 October 2021 3:48 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SKV8206A - Finalise

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 12 July 2021 8:31 am
To: cityauto@singnet.com.sg
Subject: RE: SKV8206A - Finalise

Attach finalise for SKV 8206A.

From: cityauto@singnet.com.sg [mailto:cityauto@singnet.com.sq]
Sent: Saturday, 10 July, 2021 12:22 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: SKV8206A - Finalise

Hi Kenneth,

Please find attachment for finalise.

Lump sum - $ 2.700.00 with 5days of repair.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vronica Law

City Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate,
#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road,
Singapore 575643

Tel : 6453 1235

Fax : 6453 7944
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