Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Saturday, 24 July 2021 12:02 AM
To: EM Auto

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: XD 7790 B FINALIZE
Attachments: Doc Jul 24 2021.pdf

Hi Bernard,

Kindly refer our finalize $3850 (L/S, before GST). 5 repair days.

Kindly confirm

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steven Foong| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: EM Auto <emautosolution@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 22 July 2021 1:45 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: XD 7790 B FINALIZE

Hi Steve,
Can please finalize XD 7790 B surveyed on 12-07-2021

Thanks el regards,

Bernard
}[p: 91018302



