Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Winnie,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 24 August 2021 9:57 AM
connect3winnie@gmail.com; Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
connect3lau@gmail.com

FW: Finalization for PC4408B

PC 4408 main estimate.pdf

Sorry, there is some calculation error on the labour cost.

Kindly re-confirmed Lump Sum $6950 @ 6 days.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 August 2021 9:28 AM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Finalization for PC4408B

Hi Veron,

Finalize confirm.



Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 24 August 2021 9:18 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: Finalization for PC4408B

Noted with thanks.

On Mon, Aug 23, 2021 at 9:52 PM Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen @lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Winnie,

Kindly refer our finalize.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 August 2021 10:41 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>
Subject: Finalization for PC4408B

Hi Steve
Attached is the after repair photos.

PIs kindly revert on the finalization.



Thanks

Winnie Chai
Connect3
HP:9850-9666

Winnie Chai
Connect3
HP:9850-9666



