Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Veron,

Claims Dept <claims_rar@bifrostauto.com>
Wednesday, 21 July 2021 8:38 PM

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

SUR; TG Lim (LKK Auto); claims@bifrostauto.com
Re: SKK 3089L-DOA: 21/6/2021

We confirm finalisation at L/S $5,700 with 5 repair days.

Thank you.

The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages arising
therefrom are excluded from the ambit and application of this document.

Regards,

Suanne Tan
Motor Claims Department

On 21 Jul 2021, at 4:00 PM, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com> wrote:

<SKK 3089L MAR KEST.pdf>



