
1

Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: Chia Sin Muk <em1autopteltd@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 8 October 2021 4:45 PM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Cc: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: Finalization for vehicle SFX 1A

 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Taufikh, 
 
Confirmed COR L/S $11,400 + 6 days. 
 
Thanks & Best Regards, 
Karen, on behalf of, 
Chia Sin Muk (Mr) 
m: (65) 9666 6556 | o: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776 
  
EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd 
Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643 
Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R 
Important: This email is confidential and may be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it and notify us immediately; you should not copy or 
use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Thank you. 

 
 
On Fri, 8 Oct 2021 at 15:40, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Mr Chia, 

  

Please refer attached, COR LS$ 11,400 , 6 DAYS. 

  

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

  

From: Chia Sin Muk [mailto:em1autopteltd@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 19 August 2021 11:27 AM 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Team A 
Subject: Finalization for vehicle no. SJS 464B and SFX 1A 
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Taufikh, 

  

Kindly expedite finalization for following vehicles : 

  

1) SJS 464B - Toyota Allion, your ref. no. GBG2564R, DOA : 10.06.2021 TP - India 

2) SFX 1A - Mercedes Benz, your ref. no. SLH208J, DOA : 13.06.2021 TP - China 

  

Thanks & Best Regards, 
Karen, on behalf of, 
Chia Sin Muk (Mr) 

m: (65) 9666 6556 | o: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776 

  

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd 

Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643 

Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R 

Important: This email is confidential and may be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it and notify us immediately; you should not copy 
or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Thank you. 


