Elaine (LKK Auto)

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); KENNY LIM CHING GHEE

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; SUR

Subject: RE: [WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED][WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED]
RE: Request for paper survey for YM7386B - yref: CS3/LPC21000330/R1gd3e2 - Oref:
20/21/21/VC00/024086

Attachments: LKKAdjustment.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; LPC2-LKKInvoice-AC2104897.pdf

Dear Kenny,

Enclose Survey Report of YM 7386B.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elaine | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 12 July 2021 4:12 PM

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE; Reports (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; SUR

Subject: RE: [WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED][WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED]RE: Request for paper
survey for YM7386B - yref: CS3/LPC21000330/R1qd3e2 - Oref: 20/21/21/VC00/024086

Dear Kenny,
Please be informed that we are in the midst of preparing report.
Dear Reports Team,

Kindly expedite.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE [mailto:kennylim@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Monday, 12 July 2021 4:01 PM

To: Elaine (LKK Auto) <report@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)' <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: [WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED][WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED]RE: Request for paper
survey for YM7386B - yref: CS3/LPC21000330/R1qgd3e2 - Oref: 20/21/21/VC00/024086

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Elaine
Appreciate your update on whether the adjustment report is ready.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE

Sent: Monday, 28 June 2021 2:17 pm

To: Elaine (LKK Auto) <report@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)' <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: [WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED][WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED]RE: Request for paper
survey for YM7386B - yref: CS3/LPC21000330/R1qd3e2 - Oref: 20/21/21/VC00/024086

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Elaine

Can I check whether this Adjustment Report is ready?
Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
2



DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Elaine (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 June 2021 5:26 pm

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)' <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>
Subject: [WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED][WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED]RE: Request for paper survey
for YM7386B - yref: CS3/LPC21000330/R1qd3e2 - Oref: 20/21/21/VC00/024086

Dear Kenny,
Please find the attached photo of YM 7386B.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elaine | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE [mailto:kennylim@lonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 22 June 2021 3:37 PM

To: Elaine (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; 'SUR'; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)'

Subject: Request for paper survey for YM7386B - yref: CS3/LPC21000330/R1qd3e2 - Oref: 20/21/21/VC00/024086

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Elaine
We appreciate if you can arrange for a paper survey on TP vehicle YM7386B.

TP Survey Report can be retrieved at this link:
https://drive.google.com/file/d/1Yv569H tScab1SviTP45ZKyYPUhGDznl/view?usp=sharing

Please let us have the survey photos for YM7386B as your initial submission in January was for
our insured veh GBB9603S.

Thank you.



Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all THew [onpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Elaine (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 15 January 2021 5:10 pm

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)' <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Pre-Repair Survey Report of Vehicle YM 7386B Ref: 20/21/21/VC00/024086

Dear Kenny,

Enclose Pre-Repair Survey Report of YM 7386B.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elaine | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices.



