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Re: SKV632E, Accident dated 18 May 2021,

William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com>
Thu 28/10/2021 8:22 AM
To:  Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; William Tan
<tanlihao74@gmail.com>

Understand Sir 

On Thu, 28 Oct 2021 at 8:20 AM, Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> wrote:


LOD send to AGI, thanks.

 

From: William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 27 October 2021 9:18 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)
<KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; William Tan <tanlihao74@gmail.com>

Subject: SKV632E, Accident dated 18 May 2021,

 

Dear Sir,

SKV632E, Accident dated 18 May 2021 (Claim against Auto & General  Insurance).

I accept lump sum cost of repairs amount at $2,800.00 and accept 4 working days for the repair
work.

By the way, all documents send to LKK or directly to Auto & General Insurance ?

Thank you Sir.
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