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Elaine (LKK Auto)

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Stanley Lai; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments

Cc: Claims; Charandeep Singh

Subject: RE: Paper Survey Request || Budget Direct Claim: C10009585

Attachments: AGI-LKKInvoice-GBF 6542H.pdf; LKKAdjustment.pdf; LKKLetter-GBF 6542H.pdf

Dear Stanley, 

 

  

Enclose Evaluation Report of GBF 6542H. 

 
 

Thank you. 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Elaine | Reports 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111   Fax: 6741-4108   email: report@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933 

 

 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 28 June 2021 5:19 PM 

To: Stanley Lai; Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments; Reports (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Claims; Charandeep Singh 

Subject: Re: Paper Survey Request || Budget Direct Claim: C10009585 

 

Dear Stanley, 

 

They report is in preparation, will sent to you once done 

 

Dear Report Team, 

 

Please expidited  

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Stanley Lai <stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Sent: Monday, 28 June 2021 5:14 PM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 



2

Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Paper Survey Request || Budget Direct Claim: C10009585  

  
Dear LKK Team, 

  

May we have the report soonest possible? 

  

Thank you. 

  

Regards, 
  
Stanley Lai 
Executive, Claims 
  
T +65 6540 2189 
F +65 6725 0853  
E stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg 
   

  
  
Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
  
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 

239924                                                                                                                                  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
  

 
  
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct 

Insurance. 

  

  

From: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 21 June 2021 12:28 pm 

To: Stanley Lai <stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments@lkkauto.com 

Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Paper Survey Request || Budget Direct Claim: C10009585 

  

  

  

Dear Sir / Mdm, 

  

Thank you for your assignment. 
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Best Regards, 

Summer Lee | Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 

#02-25 | S(408933) 

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

From: Stanley Lai <stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 21 June, 2021 12:21 PM 

To: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: Paper Survey Request || Budget Direct Claim: C10009585 

  

Hi LKK Team, 

  

Kindly assess consistency of damages for GBF6542H and let us have your paper survey soonest possible. 

  

Thanks. 

  

Regards, 
  
Stanley Lai 
Executive, Claims 
  
T +65 6540 2189 
F +65 6725 0853  
E stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg 
   

  
  
Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
  
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 

239924                                                                                                                                  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
  

 
  
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct 

Insurance. 
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This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited, Easy 

Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. The views 

expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto 

& General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended 

addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email 

is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. 

Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.  

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. 

Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the 

intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated 

author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may 

be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any 

use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please 

immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is 

error or virus free.  


