Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 21 June 2021 10:37 AM

To: '‘Ryder Auto workshop'; assignments; Admin A

Subject: RE: Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your Vehicle SLJI6090E; Our Vehicle SJIT7819K

Accident involving SLJ6090E & SJT7819K On 21/6/2021

Categories: HMK

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 21 June, 2021 10:32 AM

To: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your Vehicle SLI6090E; Our Vehicle SJT7819K Accident involving
SLJ6090E & SJT7819K On 21/6/2021

Byder
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2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921

Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277
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—————————— Forwarded message ---------
From: Ryder Auto workshop <ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, Jun 21, 2021 at 10:30 AM




Subject: Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your Vehicle SLI6090E; Our Vehicle SIT7819K Accident involving SLJ6090E &
SJT7819K On 21/6/2021
To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>, Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>

Dear Mei Kwan,
We refer to the above matter.

Please assist to establish liability before we request for survey.
This PRS is on a "Direct Settlement" basis, claiming against AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.
Thank you.

Best regards
Orson

y Auto Pte [td

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 22 AutoHub @ Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417921

Tel : 67418277 Fax: 67468277
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