Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 July 2021 12:32 pm
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: CI/TP21006822/Dq

This report you haven’t submit for closure. Please do asap.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 25 June 2021 4:26 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: CI/TP21006822/Dq

Hi Shiau Chan
Please close the above case.
To bill $350/-.

Email invoice to ck.globalcarz@gmail.com

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




