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KIM KOCK MOTOR PTE LTD

Blk 274, Jurong Port Road, # 01-19, Singapore 619101
Tel : 62650226, 6265 0358 Fax : 6265 2588
Email : kimkockmotor@gmail.com

Our Ref : KKMPL/LR/2021009/001
Your Ref: YN 9277P
16.5EPTEMBER.2021

Atin : Ms Cecilia Chong (Claims Department)
LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

#02-25

Singapore 408933

TO: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Re: Accident Involving Vehicle Number FBG3604C & YN9277P Date of Accident : 07/06/2021

We refer to the above matter.

We enclosed our Cover Letter, our Invoices No:  CAD0111 dd : 16.09.2021
Total Repair Cost : $2,200.00 plus Loss of use @5$30/- X 4days = $120.00
and the Authorization Letter for your references.

Kindly assist us for processing for this Third Party Claim .
if you have any enquiries please feel free to contact us.
Thank you

Regards,

From

Kim Kock Motor Pte Lid

Ms How / Mr Gan
Tel : 6265 0226 /6265 0358 Foax ; 6265 2588



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
(CSI Express Third Party Claim)

I, MOHAMED FIRDAUS BIN MOHAMED ISMAIL ("the third party claimant")

of BLK 180 YUNG SHENG ROAD #04 - 107 SINGAPORE 610180

(address),owner of FBG 3604C (vehicle no.) hereby authorize
KIM KOCK MOTOR PTE LTD

("the workshop") to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/

or loss of use ("claim") for my vehicle no. FBG 3604C that was damaged

pursuant to the accident which occurred on  07/06/2021 (date) along

YUNG KUANG ROAD

(location) involving vehicle no/s : YN 9277P ("the accident").

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that
they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to
settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalfis on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/
insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this ~ 30th day of JUNE (month)20 21 (year)

>

Signed by "the third party claimant" Signmw "the wb rkshop (with chop)



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Provided always that this discharge of my

CLAIM NO :20/21/21/VC05/024636 claim for damages relating to the damage to

. my vehicle shall not prejudice or affect my
DATE : 29 NOVEMBER 2021 further claim for general and special

damages for my personal injuries sustained

DISCHARGE VOUCHER in the same accident.

I/We, Mohamed Firdaus Bin Mohamed Ismail confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of YN 9277P the sum of Singapore
Dollar Two Thousand Two Hundred Eighty Only ($2,280.00) in full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon
the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving FBG 3604C and YN 9277P on 07
June 2021 along Yung Kuang Rd.

[ /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ TEO SOON SENG PTE LTD AND/OR CHIU ENG HUA) against all
claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in
respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to KIM KOCK
MOTOR PTE LTD.

[/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Name of vehicle owner /Date



TAX INVOICE
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Cheque made in favour of Kim Kock Motor Pte Ltd.

I

Signature & Company's Stamp For Kim Kock Motor Pte Ltd




Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 November 2021 9:28 am

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Su Li (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: FW: Vehicle Involve : FBG3604C & YN9277P , Date of Accident : 07/06/2021 LKK

REF : CC4/LPC21006788/gs3 -LPI Ref: 20/21/21/VC05/024636 [External General]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Cecilia

Please proceed as recommended.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all C8ew " lonpac

"In view of the revised measures for transition under Phase 2 COVID-19 restrictions effective
19 August 2021, 50% of our staff will be working from home. Please expect delays in our
replies, payments and claims settlements during this period. Your understanding is greatly
appreciated and we apologise for any inconvenience caused”.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 November 2021 12:36 pm

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@Ilonpac.com>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FW: Vehicle Involve : FBG3604C & YN9277P , Date of Accident : 07/06/2021 LKK REF :
CC4/LPC21006788/gs3 -LPI Ref: 20/21/21/VC05/024636 [External General]

Lonpac Ref: 20/21/21/VC05/024636

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21006788/gs3



Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 21/06/2021 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our

Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a BOLA S9 collision. Liability is not in our driver’s favour.

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “KIM KOCK MOTOR PTE LTD” is as follows: -

Claimed Amount

Revised Amount

1. Cost of Repair $ 4,459.00 $ 2,200.00
2. Loss of Use (4days x $30.00) $ 120.00 $ 120.00 (4days x $30.00)
3.LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ - $ -

Total | $ 4,579.00 $2,320.00

**04days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence
should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be

in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd




