Our Ref; PTE/SLS7490E/210607/TP/AL
Date: 13.07.2021

SIPARK

LCAR CARE

China Taiping Insurance Co {S)Pte Ltd
3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
Singapore 079909

Attn : Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice

ComfortDelGro Engineering

ComfortDelGro Engineeting Pie Lid

Corpurate Gifice

205 Bradde!l Road Singapore 579701

Dear Sir/Madam

Cumpany Regivirating Mo 199

ACCIDENT ON 07.06.2021 INVOLVING SLS7490E & SLV2900G ALONG MOULMEIN ROAD

We are the authorised repair workshop for the owner of vehicle No, SLS7490E, which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle No, SLV2S00G.

The vehicle owner has requested and authorised us to assist in presenting his/her claims against the
party responsible for all applicable matters arising from the damage of the vehicle.

As the vehicle was caused by the negligent act of your insured driver, we are submitting these claims
for your consideration on behalf of the the owner/driver/claimant.

1. Cost of Repairs / Excess SS 1,678.72
2. Car Rental days x S$ 0.00 SS 0.00
3. Loss of Use 6 days x S$ 118.00 SS 708.00
4. Survey Report Fee S$ 0.00
5. LTA Search Fee SS 0.00
6. GIA / Police Report Fee SS 2.00
7. Medical Expenses SS 0.00
8. Others [1] SS 0.00
9. Others [2] SS 0.00
[E&OE] Total Claims S$ 2,388.72

Mainline + 65 6383 6280
Facsimile +65 6280 9758

Car Lare Contros

i

320 Ubl Road 3
Singapore 40864G
il 68348 5721

www SPARKcarcare.com

A copy each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:

=T  Original Repair/Excess Bill [+ Insurance Certificate
[ 1] SurveyReport/ Bill [+ Power of Attorney

[ 1 Coloured Photographs [ 1 CarRentalBill

[ 1 GIA/Police Report(s) [ 1] MedicalBill

LA GIA/TP Search [ ] Witness Statement

[ 1 Others:

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our clients' claims as soon
as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any
personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/driver/claimant.

Yours sincerely,

Alice Lau

CDGE Claims Department
DID:62148307

FAX:62141843 Email:alicelau@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer-generated letter. No signature is required.

A member of

COMFORIDELGRO




ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Litd

Corporate Office Car Care Centres
205 Bradderil Road g?? Bradc}el! Boagl_Sin/gapmf(ﬁjt):}"wm TQOEQSSE 8110 A -
W SPARH
ket hibbelewsy Lo caAR GARE
320 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408649 Yel: 6848 5721 X i
weww SPARKcal care com ComfortDelGro Engineering
COMP. N 3
TAX INVOICE MBsiEciRo. W2pgsRd v s
i
8010012 VEHCLE NO INVOICE NO./DATE
SLS7490E 91573009 26.06.2021
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO (S)PTE L
SPRINGLEAF TOWER MAKE JOB NO.
. NISSAN 305473608
3 ANSON ROAD #16-00 _
MODEL ODOMETER READING
SINGAPORE SG 079909 QASHOAT |
DATE OF REG
CONTACT NO: 62222366 03.10.2017
CHASSIS C
SJNFEAJ11U4016684

‘Description : TP - INDIA - CHINA TAIPING

S/No Part No. Qty Unit Price Net
Description |
) |
01 20-501 1 EAC 550.00 8GD 550,00
LABOUR CHARGES
02 1979 1 PC 717.30  SGD 717.30
REAR BUMPER- SLS7490E
03 1979 1 PC 280.00  SGD 280.00
REAR BUMPER SENSOR SLS7490E
04 1979 1 PC 21.60 3GD 21.60
REAR BRUMPER TOW COVER—SLS749OE
Ttems total 1,568.90
Add GST @ 7.000 % 109.82
Involce amount 1,678.72
Issued by : SIEWHWA 26 06.2021 11:26:23

Repair type CES0/52/5T
Payment Type/Term: /Credit 30 days

Cheque should be crossed and made payable to “"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd“
“omfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

- member of COMFORIDELCRO ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.
lead Office: i

05 Braddell Road 8010012, 91573009 1,678.7:

1k C Ext | Level 2 ;

ingapore 579701

({tn: Finance Department
ndly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requested.

'STOMER’S COPY




6/23/2021 Mail - Ngo Toh Wee - Outlook

RE: SLS7490E FINALIZE

Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>
Wed 23/6/2021 8:17 AM

To: Ngo Toh Wee <Ngotw@sparkcarcare.com>

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or
open attachment unless you know the sender.

Final repair cost $1568.90, 2days confirmed. Kenneth

From: Ngo Toh Wee <Néotw@sparkcarcare.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 22 June 2021 9:51 am

. To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Kristy Tay Siew Hwa <kristytay@sparkcarcare.com>; Brenda Ng Lay Hong <BrendaNg@sparkcarcare.com>;
Rohani Binte Mustafa <RohaniM@sparkcarcare.com>; Choo Jing Yuan <choojy@cdge.com.sg>; Patrick Tia lee
Kiang <PatrickTia@sparkcarcare.com>; Mark Wong Lian Sheng <wonglsm@sparkcarcare.com>
Subject: SLS7490E FINALIZE

Hi Kenneth,
Please check and confirm.

Regards,
Ngo Toh Wee

Workshop Supervisor (Accident Repair)
T: 6383 7656 | M: 87983946

W: www.SPARKcarcare.com.sg

From: Toh Wee Ngo <wee_75@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 22 June 2021 9:42 AM

To: Ngo Toh Wee <Ngotw@sparkcarcare.com>
Subject:

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or
open attachment unless you know the sender.

Sent from my Huawei phone

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient,
kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or
disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed
by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and
are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKAGYwWNzAOMmMEOLTQOMzUtNDZhMi1iMzAWLWEwWODMxMzJjNDBIZQAQADOZhGzE3uBArwBOugx... 1/2




Insurer Enquiry — GEARS Page 1 of 1

INSURER ENQUIRY
% RESULT & RECEIPT
Find
insurer
TP Insurer Enquiry

Vehicle reg. no.

SLV29006 insurance China Taiping Insurance (SiBE®
Date of Accident Period of INSUrance ... B 27/12/2020- 26/12/2021
07/06/202% Requested BY ... Kristy Tay (ComfortDelGroBRR
Requested Date 28/06/2021 08:57
Reset
Payment details General Insurance Association
Request Amount: $$1.87 Records Management Centre
GST Amount: $$0.13 GST Registration No: M400017735

Total Amount Due (GST
Inclusive): $$2

file:///C:/Users/escoaa02/AppData/Local/Temp/Low/7MBY35VD.htm 28/06/2021




. . INDIA INDTA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
| ey
. 5 l - Co. Regr, N, 1987937602k § GST. Reg. No, M2-0078806-X
NTERNATIONAL
@ I ERNATIO 64 | Geeld Steeet | #04 § #65 | #06-02 | 108 Building § Singapore 0497913
4 NSURANCE Office {653 63476100 Fanail  Insure@iii.com.sg
g - “s':_'&:”: Fax  (65) 63244174 Website wwwiiicomsy

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) ACT (CHAPTER 189)
MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION) RULES, 1960 ROAD TRANSPORT ACT, 1987 (MALAYSIA)
MOTOR VEHICLES (THIRD-PARTY RISKS) RULES, 1959 (MALAYSIA)

All Accidents must be reported within 24 hours of the incident regardless of whether it will lead to a claim.

CERTIFICATE NO.: D20MFL0000326 01 COVER: Comprehensive
1. Index Mark and Registration Number of Vehicle :  SLS7490E
Chassis No : SINFEAJ11U2016684
2. Name of Policyholder :  COMFORTDELGRO RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD
3 Effective date of Insurance : 01Jan2021
4. Expiry date of Insurance ¢ 30 Jun 2022
5. Persons or Classes of Persons entitled to drive*

Any person who is driving on the Policyholder's order or with their permission.

Provided that the person driving is permitted in accordance with the licensing or other laws or regulations to drive the Motor Vehicle or has been so
permitted and is not disqualified by order of a Court of Law or by reason of any enactment or regulation in that behalf from driving the Motor Vehicle

6. Limitations as to use*
Use only for social domestic and pleasure purposes in connection with the Policyholder’s business.
The Policy does not cover

(1) Use for hire or reward

(2) Use for racing, pace-making, reliability trial or speed-testing.

(3) Use for the carriage of goods (other than samples) in connection with any trade or business.
(4) Use for any purposes in connection with the Motor Trade.

*Limitations rendered inoperative by Section 8 of the Motor Vehicles (Third-Party Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189)and Section 95 of the Road
Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia), are nci'to be included under these headings.

Windscreen Excess : SGD 100.00
Hire Purchase Company : N.A

EXCESS : AS PER POLICY SCHEDULE

I/'We HEREBY CERTIFY that the Policy to which this Certificate relates is issued in accordance with the provisions of the Motor Vehicles (Third-Party
Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189) and Part [V of the Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia).

Agent/Broker  : B000018/COMFORTDELGRO INSURANCE BROKERS PTE LTD For India International Insurance Pte Ltd
Date of Issue :29/12/2020 22:10:44
MZ406 — Hire Car (Hired Driving)

n
Authorised Signatory

letchmy/29/12/2020 22:10:44 29/12/2020 22:41:25




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

A member of COMFORIDLIGRO

POWER OF ATTORNEY |
ACCIDENT INVOLVING (Owner’s Vehicle No.) S OF- and (Third Party’sVehicle No.)
Vi [/1‘:1 :/"I(.It_f?;f on /’}/(:\f//)//’ along jf_‘,’n /?’ (_/’;‘47 (:‘-//‘U V4 @C';/}\H:) -

Policy Nos: ﬁ ﬁa,)J?/:Zﬁ?Jﬁ 7 3_(?’,/0 / ) ;
/ _-1, v BN 2 L ,!'/'"-_ 27 "_:: ! -~ 1 4 _)
BY THIS POWER OF ATTORNEY, *IWe, £V/U)/ 1/ )5 Qe NEDX/ A CAR /ZC*NRIC/Passpon

No. (Address)*

/ a company

incorporate in Singapore and having its registered office at (Address)”

_ owner of Vehicle Registered No. _

$757 ?,//c/_c; z

hereby irrevocably appoint ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (CDGE), a

company incorporated in Singapore and having its registered office at

ts agents or any person authorized by CDGE to be *my/our Attomey and in *my/our name(s) and on *my/our behalf
to do all or any of the following:

1. To submit, resolve and make any claim(s) (including the commencement of legal proceedings) which *l/we may
have against the other *party/parties to the Accident and under the insurance *policy/policies taken up by such
*party/parties or altematively under Insurance Policy No. - ~taken up by *me/us in respect

of the cost of repairs, loss of use and at all other costs and expenses, etc. suffered by *mefus arising from the
Accident (loss and damage)..

2. Forthe purpose of such claim(s) as aforesaid, to appoint solicitors on *my/our behalf as * my/our Atomey shall in his absolute
discretion, deem fit.

3. To collect payment(s) due in respect of any such claim(s) for the loss and damage, such payment to be made
by way of cheque in favor of ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd , CDGE and to give a valid receipt and discharge
therefor.

4.  For any of the purposes aforesaid, to execute, sign, seal and deliver all documents whatsoever in relation thereto.
5. Generally do all such acts as it shall deem necessary for the purpose of settling such claim(s) and

6. To agree to any settlement at the absolute discretion of CDGE.

*I/We hereby declare that all acts, instruments and documents done by virtue of this Power of Attorney on *my/our

behalf by the Attorney, its agents or any person authorized by CDGE in that behalf shall be as good valid and effectual
to all intents and purposes whatsoever as if the same had been done or executed by *me/us in *mylour own proper
Person(s) and *I/We hereby ratify and confirm, all acts, instruments and documents done or executed by virtue of
he authority and powers hereby conferred.

*|/We hereby further declare that the powers and authority hereby conferred shall remain irrevocable.

*|/We further confirm that the acceptance by CDGE of the settlement amount in respect of such constitute the full discharge
of my/our claim(s) in respect of such loss and damage.

*IN WITNESS WHEREOF. *I/We have hereunto to set “my/our hand and seal this day.—————— of the month of
(20—)

ear Two Thousand -

Signed, Sealed & Deyi

Customers Name:
NRIC No.:
Co’s rubber Stamp

delete as appropriate. File




