Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 9 July 2021 2:27 pm
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SHC3465L FINALISE
Attachments: final.pdf

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 9 July 2021 2:27:09 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Jumani Bin Masudin <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SHC3465L FINALISE

Hi Jumani,
Refer attached, COR P/P $10,005.17, 4 days.
Regards

Taufikh
LKK



