Gina Tay

Subject: FW: LIPL ref. IV521/0865 \\ your veh. XE3815K - WITHDRAWAL OF INJURY CLAIM

From: Aguilar Jay [mailto:leocadio.jay@libertyinsurance.com.sq]

Sent: Friday, 11 June, 2021 11:04 AM

To: Gina Tay

Cc: kuanhwa@singnet.com.sq

Subject: LIPL ref. IVS21/0865 \\ your veh. XE3815K - WITHDRAWAL OF INJURY CLAIM

Dear Ms. Tay,

Thank you for your advice. We note that your employee (passenger) did not suffer any injuries and as such, no injury
claim then.

About your property damage claim, we will apprise respective case handler to look out for your claim in any event.

Take care and stay safe.

Best regards,

Jay Leocadio
Claims Department

Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd

51 Club Street #03-00 Liberty House
Singapore 069428

DID: (65) 6506 4929
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From: Gina Tay <ginatay@ubts.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 10 June 2021 1:50 PM

To: Aguilar Jay <leocadio.jay@libertyinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: kuanhwa@singnet.com.sg

Subject: {EXTERNAL} WITHDRAWAL OF INJURY CLAIM INVOLVEMENT OF YOUR REF: LIPL ref. IVS21/0865 \\ your veh.
XE3815K - Injury claim

Dear Mr Jay,

Noted your concern of our Passenger hand injury involvement, we hereby inform you that we are not claiming any
Medical Ins of his hand injury after upon gathering material facts from the involved driver,Qi Ji.

Material facts gathered is that due to sudden brake impact of our XE 3815 K to avoid further collision onto your
Insured vehicle,it had caused the front left passenger hand to jerk forward and hit against the windscreen and
fortunately sustained NIL injury.

Therefore, we shall inform our concerned Party to withdraw his injury claim BUT not others.



Trust we clarifies the subject matter and kindly expedite the claim settlement to our workshop.
<Aside to our Kuan Hwa-Ms Adeline, please note to inform lawyer involved....tks>

Tks,regards

From: Aguilar Jay [mailto:leocadio.jay@libertyinsurance.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 8 June, 2021 10:18 AM

To: ginatay@ubts.com.sg

Subject: LIPL ref. IVS21/0865 \\ your veh. XE3815K - Injury claim

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Ms. Tay,

This refers to your employees road traffic accident on 4™ June 2021 involving our insured vehicle GBD4405U and your
prime mover XE3815K driven by Mr. Qi Ji at Pioneer Road approaching round about.

We assessed that our insured is at fault for causing the accident based on accident reports and video submitted to us.
We are expecting your nominated workshop to contact us to handle replacement of windshield and repair of your
vehicle XE3815K.

Related to your Property Damage claim, we note that one of the passenger hit his hand at the windshield. How is he
now? Did he went to doctor for consultation and treatment? We pray for your full recovery.

In case you have not filed any insurance claim like Workmen Insurance compensation or Personal Accident, please
submit your medical invoice and other related documents such as medical certificate indicating diagnosis for us to
refund your medical and related expenses. This is to allow us to settle your medical claims directly with you without
incurring further legal cost in appointing lawyer.

However, we will deal with your lawyer should you opt to appoint one to handle the medical/ injury claims. Please
advise.

Take care and stay safe.

Best regards,

Jay Leocadio
Claims Department

Liberty Insurance Pte Ltd

51 Club Street #03-00 Liberty House
Singapore 069428

DID: (65) 6506 4929
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