Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Taxis Customer Service <taxiscs@stengg.com>

Sent: Thursday, 8 July 2021 10:06 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); claims@dingautomotive.com; kelly.ding@dingauto.sg;
sarah@dingautomotive.com

Subject: RE: 50113135 / SHB2889)J - Finalize Amount, Before & After Repair Photo . (DOA:
11/06/2021)

Attachments: Revise Estimate.pdf

Hi Rasul,

Kindly refer attached.
We had requested these few items LIST PRICE from our supplier.

List Price (Before -20%)

Rear RH Bumper Reflector - § 58.60

Rear Fog Lamp Assy - $ 356.80

Smart Key Antenna Assy - $ 128.86

Rear Licence Plate Lamp Assy - S 76.88 (per pc)
Rear Boot Weatherstrip - $ 275.40

Rear Tailgate Panel Trim Assy - $ 259.30

Rear RH Luggage Side tray Assy - S 334.43

This vehicle model is Hyundai lonig New Model.
Shall can we re-finalize at $ 15,292.30 Part By Part Repair?
As per calculated :

Labour =$ 2,860.00
S/N=51,035.00

Parts =$ 11,397.30
L+S+P = $ 15,292.30
Total = $ 15,292.30

Thank You
Best Regards,

Gowwxg/
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
Hp : 93299929

Office : 62657130

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 8, 2021 11:13 AM



To: Taxis Customer Service <taxiscs@stengg.com>
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 50113135 / SHB2889] - Finalize Amount, Before & After Repair Photo . (DOA: 11/06/2021)

##% WARNING! THIS EMAIL ORIGINATES FROM OUTSIDE ST ENGINEERING. **%*
Do not click on links or attachments if you are unsure of the source.

Hi Guang,

Refer to attachment

Audit check part prices high

Finalised amount is $ 14,856.73 / 9 days of P/P repair
Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ESL”
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From: Taxis Customer Service [mailto:taxiscs@stengg.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 30 June, 2021 10:38 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: claims@dingautomotive.com; kelly.ding@dingauto.sg; sarah@dingautomotive.com

Subject: 50113135 / SHB2889] - Finalize Amount, Before & After Repair Photo . (DOA: 11/06/2021)

Without Prejudice

Dear Rasul,
Please see below for the finalize according to our conversation to finalize for SHB2889).

Please refer attachment Estimate, Before & After Paint for SHB2889).

Part-by-Part Repair

Total Repair — 09 Days
Labour = $ 2,860.00

S/N=51,035.00



Parts=$ 12,870.85
L+S+P =S 16,765.85

Total Finalize Amount = $ 16,765.85.

Thanks!
Best Regards,

Guang

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd/
Hp : 93299929

Office : 62657130
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immediately and notify us. Please do not copy, distribute, or disseminate part or whole of this email if you are
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under circumstances permitted by applicable laws, to retain, monitor, and intercept email messages to and from
our systems. Thank you.
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