10/6/21, 12:55 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YM2063R & GBG4188E ON 03/06/2021

Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Wed 6/10/2021 12:20 PM
To: vmo1@bigfoot.com.sg <vmo1@bigfoot.com.sg>

Cc: roslee@bigfoot.com.sg <roslee@bigfoot.com.sg>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ilkkauto.com>

Dear Maya,
Confirm lump sum $5750, 4days
please submit your relevant documents to China tai ping directly

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 October 2021 5:28 pm

To: Maya <vmol@bigfoot.com.sg>

Cc: Roslee Puasa <roslee@bigfoot.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YM2063R & GBG4188E ON 03/06/2021

Hi Maya,

Kindly request after spray photo. Than i will finalize with you.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Maya <vmol@bigfoot.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 October 2021 5:01 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Roslee Puasa <roslee@bigfoot.com.sg>

Subject: Fw: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YM2063R & GBG4188E ON 03/06/2021

Dear Steve,
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Kindly refer to our email below, which was actually meant for you but was sent to the Admin at LKK
Auto. | am not sure if you had received the below email. Your markings are attached here for easy
reference.

As for the settlement of this case, we seek your utmost cooperation to settle at $6,550, breakdown as

follows:

Markings Offer S $5,750.00
4 Days' LOU ($200.00 x 4 days) $  $800.00
TOTAL $ $6,550.00
Thank you.

From: Maya

Sent: 20 September 2021 11:57

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Cc: Roslee Puasa; LST-MANAGEMENT

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YM2063R & GBG4188E ON 03/06/2021

OUR REF: YM2063R DOA 03/06/21
YOUR REF: SNM21D203314/C02/GBG4188E/TANKW/RE: YM2063R & GBG4188E - DOA 03/06/2021

Dear Yan,

Mr. Steve Chen of LKK did the survey on our vehicle YM2063R and his markings are attached here for
your reference.

Kindly update Mr. Steve Chen that we would like to settle at $6,550, breakdown as follows:

Markings Offer S $5,750.00
4 Days' LOU ($200.00 x 4 days) S  $800.00
TOTAL $ $6,550.00
Thank you.

Warmest regards,
@
Maya
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This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom
they are addressed. If you have received this email in error please notify helpline@bigfoot.com.sg. This message contains
confidential information and is intended only for the individual named. If you are not the named addressee you should not

disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by
mistake and delete this e-mail from your system.

ﬁ Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.
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