Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 16 June 2021 3:39 PM

To: Claims

Subject: RE: AAD2106-030 FINALISE -- SHD9448S

Confirmed.

From: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 16 June 2021 11:36 am

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: AAD2106-030 FINALISE -- SHD9448S

Dear Kenneth
Due to the size of after paint photo, will split the photo into two email.
Best Regards

Amanda
Claims Department

From: Claims [mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, June 16, 2021 11:31 AM

To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: AAD2106-030 FINALISE -- SHD9448S

Dear Kenneth

We would like to finalize with you for this case.

Here’s the working for your perusal.

Kindly please check and confirm the amount if agreeable.

Thank you.



AAD2106-030
SHD94485-AUTO & GENERAL- 08.06.21

PARTS
$ 925.60
) 54.60
b 24,60
$ 47.90
$ 451.80
) 442.60
b 15.40
$ 123.70
$ 576.30
$ 2,682.50
25% § 673.13
$ 2,019.38

S/NETT
$ 50.00
$ 30.00
g 30.00
$ 110.00

LABOUR
g 440.00
$ 20.00
$ 300.00
$ 760.00
g 2,889.38

0% $ -
$ 2,889.38

PART-BY-E § 2,889.38

AFTER GST § 3,091.64



Best Regards

Amanda
Claims Department



