6/11/2021 Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Vehicle FBE6724E, Ref: MT/1084576-001, DOS: 29/01/2020 (URGENT)

Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Fri 11/6/2021 10:00 AM

To: Zuraimee Bin Mantau <zuraimee.mantau@income.com.sg>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Janice Lee
(LKKAuto) <JaniceLee@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Dear Zuraimee,
Apologise for the delay.

The market value for FBE 6724E is $1200-1500(est) as at Jan 2020

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Zuraimee Bin Mantau <zuraimee.mantau@income.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 11 June 2021 9:43 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>; Janice Lee (LKKAuto) <JaniceLee@I|kkauto.com>; Veron
Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Vehicle FBE6724E, Ref: MT/1084576-001, DOS: 29/01/2020 (URGENT)

Dear LKK
We have not received your reply to our request for the vehicle market value.
Please response.

Thank you

Zuraimee Bin Mantau
Senior Executive
Operations, Motor & Personal Lines

T: +65 6430 7891

(7 INncome

made yours

From: Zuraimee Bin Mantau

Sent: Wednesday, 2 June 2021 10:42 AM

To: 'siewsc@lkkauto.com' <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; 'Janice Lee (LKKAuto)' <JaniceLee@Ilkkauto.com>;
'shirleyhiew@Ilkkauto.com' <shirleyhiew@Ikkauto.com>; 'veronchen@lkkauto.com'
<veronchen@lkkauto.com>; 'sur@lkkauto.com' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Vehicle FBE6724E, Ref: MT/1084576-001, DOS: 29/01/2020

Importance: High

Dear LKK
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Please help on the market value for the motorbike as at time of stolen on 29/01/2020.
There is no record in the LTA website for the vehicle detail. Owner provided the vehicle logcard attached.

Thank you

Zuraimee Bin Mantau
Senior Executive
Operations, Motor & Personal Lines

T: +65 6430 7891

{7 INncome

made yours

Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the
recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete all copies of it. Thank you.
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